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STAFF MEETING MINUTES 
LANCASTER COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

THURSDAY, JUNE 25, 2020 
COUNTY-CITY BUILDING 

ROOM 112 – CITY/COUNTY CHAMBERS 
8:30 A.M. 

 
Commissioners Present:  Sean Flowerday, Chair; Rick Vest, Vice Chair; Roma Amundson, Deb 
Schorr and Christa Yoakum 
 
Others Present:  Kerry Eagan and Dave Derbin, Chief Administrative Officers; Ann Ames, Deputy 
Chief Administrative Officer; and Leslie Brestel, County Clerk’s Office 

 
Advance public notice of the Board of Commissioners Staff Meeting was posted on the County-
City Building bulletin board and the Lancaster County, Nebraska web site and provided to the 
media on June 24, 2020. 

 
The Chair noted the location of the Open Meetings Act and opened the meeting at 8:32 a.m.   
 

AGENDA ITEM 
 

1. APPROVAL OF STAFF MEETING MINUTES FOR JUNE 18, 2020 
 

MOTION:  Vest moved and Amundson seconded approval of the June 18, 2020 Staff Meeting 
minutes.  Amundson, Schorr, Yoakum, Vest and Flowerday voted yes.  Motion carried 5-0. 

 
2. LEGISLATIVE UPDATE – Joe Kohout and Brennen Miller, Kissel, Kohout, ES Associates 

LLC   
 
Kohout reviewed the weekly legislative report (Exhibit 1).  He noted there is discussion 
regarding the possibility of reserving some of the CARES Act funding for vaccines.  He 
suggested further discussion with the Board at a later date. 
 
Additionally, the Legislative Speaker’s procedural changes memorandum was distributed (Exhibit 
2). 
 
Kohout said the Tri-County Breakfast is scheduled for Monday, January 11, 2021 from 8:00 am-
10:00 a.m.  He will work with the Chief Administrative Officer to set a date for the Lancaster 
101 meeting. 
 
When asked about possible change in requirements to help alleviate overcrowding at the jail, 
Kohout stated there are bill packages in 2021. 
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3. DEPARTMENT BUDGET HEARING – Dennis Meyer, Budget and Fiscal Officer 
 
A. Aging Partners – Randy Jones, Aging Partners Director 

 
Jones gave a presentation (Exhibit 3). He said there is an increase in the number of senior 
citizens being victimized by scams. 
 
When asked about pop-up health and wellness clinics, Jones stated all areas of the county will 
be considered for these clinics.   
 
4. BUDGET UPDATE – Dennis Meyer, Budget and Fiscal Officer 
 
Meyer reviewed the budget update (Exhibit 4) stating last year’s fund balances were down 
$1,400,000 and that the $2,000,000 contingency fund has been depleted.  The draft budget will 
include a proposed $2,000,000 for the cash reserve.  The General Fund increase expenditures 
will start between $6,500,000-$7,000,000, with approximately 50% due to salaries and 
benefits.  He said he currently feels the contingency fund should not be dropped below 
$2,000,000.  Additionally, the County Engineer’s budget request is $1,800,000 more than last 
fiscal year’s dispersed amount.  He noted the Building Fund has funds for some of the Facilities 
Study priorities, but not all requests will be able to be funded. 
 
Regarding CARES Act reimbursement for COVID-19 expenses, Meyer said the reimbursement 
forms are not available until July.  An email has been sent to department heads stating all 
expenses and supporting documentation needs to be sent to him by July 3. 
 
Meyer noted the Southeast Nebraska Development District (SENDD) program public comments 
are due by June 26.  SENDD program applications will be available in mid-July. 
 
5. BOARD GOALS FOR DIVERSITY TRAINING – Doug McDaniel, Director, and Daisy 

Brayton, Human Resources Coordinator, Lincoln-Lancaster County Human Resources 
 
McDaniel reported there are trainings scheduled on September 23 and January 31 regarding 
bias and diversity.  He inquired what types of diversity trainings the Board has in mind. 
 
Schorr asked if employees are required to have diversity training.  McDaniel answered no, the 
only training required is sexual harassment retaliation.  All other trainings are available for those 
who are interested.  He added the County does not have an electronic learning management 
system, though a module could be purchased. 
 
Yoakum stated she feels diversity training should be an ongoing training, not just when an 
employee is first hired. 
 
Brad Johnson, Corrections Director, stated each employee at the jail has to go through an 
academy training center which has interactive training sessions on bias and inclusivity.  Staff 
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has been very receptive to the trainings.  He added holding training sessions for a 24/7 staffing 
situation is difficult, so advanced planning and notice is necessary. 
 
Regarding computer-based training at the jail, Johnson said an internal system has been 
developed, but there is nothing formal.  Many trainings are conducted during staff briefings. 
 
When asked what other departments are currently doing for diversity training, McDaniel 
answered some are using third-party groups to conduct trainings.  Daisy Brayton, Human 
Resources Coordinator, added she is part of The Lincoln Circle, which offers diversity trainings 
in various formats.  Yoakum added Inclusive Communities in Omaha is another organization 
that offers such trainings. 
 
Rob Ogden, County Assessor/Register of Deeds, stated his office uses LinkedIn Learning for 
both hard-skill and soft-skill teachings.  His team has had a great response with this program. 
 
6. COVID-19 UPDATE AND RESPONSE 
 
Eagan noted there was an editorial in the Lincoln Journal Star regarding the option for face 
mask requirements for the public. 
 
7. CHIEF ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER REPORT 
 

A. Legislative Retreat Location and Date 
 
Derbin noted the Legislative retreat will be held August 20 at the Lancaster County Sheriff’s 
Office (LSO) training rooms A and B.  If necessary, additional dates will be explored to 
accommodate Commissioner availability. 
 

B. Mayor's Nomination of Pablo Cervantes to the Lincoln-Lancaster County 
Planning Commission to fulfill Sham Al-Badry's unexpired term, which 
concludes August 24, 2025 

 
Derbin reviewed the nomination (see agenda packet) which will be on the July 7 agenda.  He 
added the Board has the ability to ask for additional nominations.  
 

C. Reappointment of Jim Cada to the Lancaster County Veterans Service 
committee for a term from July 1, 2020 through June 30, 2025 

 
Derbin reviewed Cada’s reappointment (see agenda packet).  This item will be on the next 
Tuesday agenda for Board action. 
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D. Pension Review Committee Membership 
 
Derbin stated he wants to formalize the Pension Review Committee and create bylaws to be 
able to keep track of the committee members (see agenda packet).  Eagan added there are 
general guidelines with the investment policy.  These committees can be held fiduciarily 
responsible if there are lawsuits. 
 
Flowerday said Pam Dingman, County Engineer, has expressed interest in serving on the 
committee.   
 
Schorr added the committee should have a retiree as a member. 
 
8. DEPUTY CHIEF ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER REPORT 
 

A. Lancaster County 2020 Priorities 
 
Regarding the Stepping Up Initiative, Schorr said Lancaster County was selected by a national 
organization to be interviewed for the program’s current outcome. 
 
Flowerday stated the Planning Commission passed the solar energy text amendment.  This will 
come to the Board in July. 
 
9. DISCUSSION OF BOARD MEMBER MEETINGS ATTENDED 
 

A. NACO Board of Directors Meeting – Amundson / Schorr 
 
The report was given at the June 18 staff meeting. 
 

B. Lancaster County Fairgrounds Joint Public Agency (JPA) – Amundson / 
Vest 

 
Amundson reported there was no meeting.  She noted the State Fair will have a show-and-go 
with the animals.  Additionally, many of the static displays will be held by Zoom. 
 

C. New Americans Task Force – Yoakum 
 
Yoakum stated the refugee resettlement coordinator is retiring.  Additionally, a survey was 
completed in relation to developing career pathways for individuals with non-USA recognized 
educational degrees.  This will be presented at the July 2 staff meeting.  
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OTHER MEETINGS 
 
City-County Common Meeting 
 
The next Common meeting will be held in Room 112 unless another location can be found. 
 
LES Zoom 
 
Schorr reported Lincoln Electric System (LES) is going to resume disconnections and collections 
of electric bills not paid due to the pandemic. 
 
10. SCHEDULE OF BOARD MEMBER MEETINGS 
 
Informational only. 
 
11. EMERGENCY ITEMS 
 
There were no emergency items. 
 
12. ADJOURNMENT 

 
MOTION:  Schorr moved and Vest seconded to adjourn the meeting at 10:36 a.m.  Schorr, 
Amundson, Yoakum, Vest and Flowerday voted yes.  Motion carried 5-0. 
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New Americans Task Force 
Immigrant and Refugee Survey Report 
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Executive Summary
In 2019, the Lincoln New Americans Task Force (NATF) conducted a first-of-its-kind survey of Lincoln’s 
immigrant and refugee community regarding health and wellness, civic engagement, housing, education/
English, economic development and community social spaces. Over 20 partner agencies and institutions 
affiliated with NATF participated in the survey creation and distribution in the Lincoln community. More 
than 500 immigrants and refugees living in Lincoln completed the survey, which was administered both on 
paper and online in English, Vietnamese, Arabic, Spanish and Karen.

Overall, the findings affirm that many immigrants and refugees value living in Lincoln and trust many of the 
city’s key institutions. They are eager to learn English, and many bring professional credentials and related 
skills from their work abroad. However, Lincoln’s immigrant and refugee community also faces significant 
economic and social barriers related to income, housing, access to effective healthcare and employment.

In particular, the 2019 Lincoln NATF Immigrant and Refugee Survey finds:

–	 Respondents value and trust components of Lincoln’s public infrastructure
	 ●	 70% of respondents indicate they have trust in Lincoln’s schools
	 ●	 74% of respondents attend events that celebrate their own culture 
	 ●	 68% report indicate they have trust in police 
	 ●	 50% of respondents indicate they utilize and feel part of City parks

–	 English acquisition is important to immigrants and refugees and for their long-term goals
	 ●	 Nearly all respondents, 99.8%, agreed or strongly agreed that English is important in their everyday lives
	 ●	 99% of respondents indicated English is important to their long-term goals

–	 A majority of respondents have educational and professional experience they are not 	
	 currently utilizing
	 ●	 64% of respondents came to the U.S. with a high school degree or higher–of those, 30% have 		
  		  post-secondary education but are not employed in their field of training
	 ●	 Nearly 60% of respondents said they do not currently work in and want to return to their professional 	
		  field of study/expertise 

–	 Respondents experience barriers that prevent them from self sufficiency and 
	 economic mobility
	 ●	 52% of respondents indicated they cannot always pay their monthly expenses
	 ●	 20% of respondents indicated their housing is either unsafe or uncomfortable; health and family 		
		  obligations are the two largest barriers to workforce participation for respondents
	 ●	 30% of respondents  stated they are unable to understand and communicate comfortably with their 	
		  health care providers

2
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Introduction
NATF is a network of nearly 70 public and private organizations and community members, dedicated to 
supporting Lincoln’s immigrant and refugee community members. NATF members strive to welcome all 
newcomers, assisting them in building the lives they seek through the removal of barriers and the provision 
of culturally competent support services.

To foster our community’s potential as we move forward, NATF is developing an Immigrant and Refugee 
Integration Plan that will be presented to and utilized by the City of Lincoln, as well as other NATF collaborating 
agencies, that emphasizes components of health, civic and social engagement, education, employment, 
social housing. To better understand the demographics, life experiences and engagement of our valued 
immigrant and refugee population, NATF conducted a survey to collect information and feedback directly 
from immigrant and refugee community members in Lincoln.

Methodology
The survey is a convenience sample of 505 self-identified immigrants and refugees in the Lincoln community 
collected from February 2019 through June 2019. NATF member agencies requested that their clients complete 
the survey, as well as self-identifying immigrant and refugee friends and family members. The survey was 
presented in both online and paper formats and translated from English into commonly spoken languages 
in Lincoln, including Arabic, Spanish, Karen and Vietnamese. Volunteers from NATF agencies translated the 
non-English survey responses and compiled the information into a data set. Data analysis includes descriptive 
statistics and ANOVA analysis (analysis of variance, a commonly used statistical modeling technique) to 
understand differences between groups. To view the survey, please refer to Appendix A. While the survey 
results are not a representative sample, the data collected offers significant insight into the experiences, 
successes and challenges faced by many immigrants and refugees who call Lincoln home.

Table of Contents
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Results

Immigration Status
All 505 respondents self- identified and reported that they are an immigrant or refugee. 

Country of Origin
Lincoln, Nebraska is home to over 30,000 immigrants and refugees from approximately 150 different 
countries. Nebraska has a long history of resettling refugees and, in 2016, Nebraska resettled more 
refugees per capita than any other state in the United States. 

While survey results are not representative of the population of Lincoln as a whole, respondents represented 
a significant number of nationalities and/or countries of origin from around the world. Respondents noted 
Iraq, Vietnam, Mexico, Myanmar, Sudan, Kurdistan and Guatemala as the most common countries of 
origin in the survey. Respondents also report many other countries of origin, illustrating Lincoln’s 
growing diversity.

FIGURE 1 
(N=457)
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1Respondents self-reported 
their country of origin 
and their responses are 
indicated in Figure 1; 
however, it is important 
to note that Kurdistan is an 
autonomous province of 
Iraq and most people from 
this area consider it an 
independent nation—for 
this reason, it is considered 
separately in this report. 
Additionally, Burma was 
renamed Myanmar 
in 1989 by military 
leadership; however, not 
all recognize the name 
change–and for this 
reason, they were 
reported differently. And, 
although South America 
was listed as an individual 
response, several countries 
in South America and 
Central America were 
represented in the survey 
responses.
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Age
Of all survey respondents, the most common age represented was 30-39 years old. After the 30-39 group, 
40-49, 21-29, 60 or older, 50-59 and 18-20 follow in descending order. Most of the data collection occurred 
at NATF partner agencies, a factor that reflects the adult age majority of data results. In the future, an 
additional survey of college-age students at Southeast Community College, area four-year colleges, and/or 
Lincoln Public Schools could improve the level of data from the youngest age group.

FIGURE 2
(N=505)

Gender
Most respondents identified as female (59%), while 41% identified as male. One respondent did not indicate 
a binary gender. 

FIGURE 3
(N=494)
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Languages Spoken
Survey participants had the option of reporting one or more languages spoken, based on personal 
preference. Many refugees and immigrants that responded to the survey reported more than one language 
spoken. The graph below illustrates the diversity of languages spoken among respondents. The most 
common languages included Spanish, Arabic, Kurdish, Vietnamese, English and Karen.

FIGURE 4
(N=439)

Length of Time in Lincoln
Survey respondents indicated the duration of time that they have been living in Lincoln. More than one-third 
(35%) of immigrated refugees that responded to the survey have lived in Lincoln less than three years. This 
represents the largest group, followed by those of 15 or more years, 3-5 years, 5-10 years, and 10-15 years.

FIGURE 5
(N=493)
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2Respondents self-reported 
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and their responses are 
indicated in Figure 2; 
however, it is important 
to note that there are 
several dialects of many 
languages, for example 
Arabic, including Sudanese 
Arabic, and Kurdish, 
including Kurmanji and 
Sorani. Additionally the 
same language can be 
referred to differently, 
for example Farsi is 
sometimes called Persian 
in the English language.
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Importance of English in Everyday Life
Nearly all respondents, over 99%, indicated they agreed or strongly agreed that English is important in their 
everyday lives.

FIGURE 6
(N=493)

English is important in my everyday life 
(ex: shopping, doctor’s appointment, functioning 
at work, communicating with school)

Percentage

Strongly agree 84%
Agree 16%
Disagree 0%
Strongly disagree 0%

English Importance in Everyday Life in Relation to Gender
ANOVA analysis indicates that males report English importance in everyday life at a higher rate than females. 
This trend is likely the result of a number of factors. Still, both females and males reported English as 
important for their everyday life.

FIGURE 7
(N=492)

English is important in my everyday life 
(ex: shopping, doctor’s appointment, 
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Mean (4=Strongly Agree, 3=Agree, 
2=Disagree, 1=Strongly Disagree)

Female 3.78 (n=291)
Male 3.88 (n=201)
Total 3.82 (n=492)

Importance of English for Long-Term Goals
Nearly all respondents, over 99%, agreed or strongly agreed that English is important to their long-term 
goals including citizenship, higher education and career advancement.

FIGURE 8
(N=494)

English is important in my long-term goals 
(ex: citizenship, higher education, and career 
advancement)

Percentage

Strongly agree 83%
Agree 16%
Disagree 1%
Strongly disagree 0%
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Importance of English for Long-Term Goals by Number of Years in Lincoln
The longer people had lived in Lincoln, the more likely they were to respond that English was important 
to their long-term goals. It is likely that this is because individuals who have recently arrived in the U.S. are 
more preoccupied with the challenge of navigating short-term survival. Results indicate that settling in a 
certain place is likely connected to investment in developing and attaining goals and developing English 
skills. All groups emphasized the high importance of English with Agree or Strongly Agree responses.

FIGURE 9
(N=493)

English is important in my long-term goals 
(ex: U.S. citizenship, higher education and 
career advancement) 

Mean (4=Strongly Agree, 3=Agree, 
2=Disagree, 1=Strongly Disagree) 

0-3 years 3.81 (n=171)
3-5 years 3.67 (n=88)
5-10 years 3.84 (n=74)
10-15 years 3.82 (n=50)
15 or more years 3.94 (n=110)

Participation in English Class
Lincoln’s immigrant and refugee community is already voting with their actions in demonstrating their 
belief in the value of English classes, with a majority of survey respondents (nearly 85%) reported having 
taken an English class. Results also indicate that more than 15% of immigrants and refugees have not taken 
an English class, which is an opportunity for improvement with community partners.

FIGURE 10
(N=494)
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Participation in English Classes by Age
Across all age groups, most respondents report participating in English classes. However, two groups were 
slightly less likely to have participated in English classes: those who are ages 21-29 and those ages 60 or older.  
The results indicate possible value in conducting outreach to the lower reporting groups to ensure that they 
know English classes are available or to identify barriers they may be facing in accessing classes.

FIGURE 11
(N=494)

Age Group Mean (1=Yes, 0=No)
18-20 3%
21-29 15%
30-39 31%
40-49 27%
50-59 11%
60 or older 12%

Participation in Cultural Events
Nearly three-fourths of respondents, 74%, reported participating in an event celebrating cultures and 
traditions of their countries of origin. The results indicate that families are aware of and have access to 
the ability to celebrate culture and connect with members of their particular communities. Significance 
testing revealed no difference between age, gender, years in Lincoln and years in the U.S. on participation 
in cultural events.

FIGURE 12
(N=492)

Do you participate in local events that celebrate your culture?

75+25No
26%

Yes
74%
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How People Learn About Community Events
If respondents answered that they participated in cultural events, they were asked about how they learned 
of them. Most respondents learned about cultural events through friends and family. In addition, respondents 
cited social media, community and cultural centers and places of worship as places where they receive 
information about cultural community events.

FIGURE 13
(N=490)

If people participated in cultural events, where did 
they learn about them? (Respondents were able 
to select multiple answers)

Percentage

Friends/family 78%
Social media 37%
Community and Cultural Centers 36%
Place of Worship 27%
Television 11%
Radio 10%
Newspaper 8%
Coworker <1%
Other <1%

Cultural Events that Immigrants and Refugees Participated In
If respondents answered that they participated in cultural events, they were asked about which type of 
events they participated in within the community. Respondents were able to select as many as they 
participated in and could write in additional events.

FIGURE 14
(N=453)

If people participated in cultural events, which 
specific events did they participate in? (Respondents 
were able to select multiple answers)

Percentage

4th of July Celebration 48%
School activities 35%
Faith community events 34%
Lincoln Farmers Market 22%
Sports Leagues 15%
I don’t participate in a cultural event 16%
Lincoln Unites! 5%
Juneteenth 4%
Write-in responses: New Year Celebration, YMCA, New Years, 
Maybe in the future, Church, I don’t know, None

1%
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How Immigrants and Refugees Learned About Events They Participated In
As a follow-up to the question on specific event attendance in the Lincoln community, respondents indicated 
how they learned about events they attended. Respondents were free to select multiple answers.

FIGURE 15
(N=395)

If people participated in cultural events, where did 
they learn about them? (Respondents were able to 
select multiple answers)

Percentage

Friends/family 81%
Social media 42%
Community and Cultural centers 28%
Place of worship 26%
School 24%
Television 16%
Radio 13%
Newspaper 13%
Write-in answers: Community leader, don’t know, work 1%

Obstacles to Attending Community Events 
As a follow-up to the question on specific events that immigrants and refugees attended, respondents 
noted why they did not attend or were not able to attend the cultural events. Respondents were able to 
select multiple answers.

FIGURE 16
(N=255)

If no, what prevents you from participating in 
these events? (Respondents were able to select 
multiple answers)

Percentage

Work schedule 36%
Didn’t know about the events 31%
Family responsibilities 29%
Transportation 20%
Childcare 15%
Health reasons 14%
Cost 13%
Other 5%
Bad weather 1%
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Where Immigrants and Refugees Feel Like They Belong
A newcomer’s sense of belonging is a critical component of both integration into a community and 
long-term positive economic and social outcomes. Respondents provided responses on public places 
where they feel they belong in the community. Respondents also provided several write-in responses 
and could select multiple answers. 

FIGURE 17
(N=470)

What places in Lincoln do you feel like you’re 
a part of? (Respondents were able to select 
multiple answers) 

Percentage

Parks 50%
Places of worship 44%
Places of education 39%
Community and Cultural centers 36%
Libraries 27%
Fitness centers 23%
Write-in answers: Church, home, workplaces, 
bike club, none 1 (less than 1%)

Trust in Community Institutions and Organizations
Respondents provided responses on which organizations they trust in the community. Respondents also 
provided several write-in responses and could select multiple answers. 

FIGURE 18
(N=467)

What organizations do you trust? (Respondents 
were able to select multiple answers) Percentage

School 70%
Police 68%
Fire department 57%
Ambulance 57%
City Government 53%
Write-in answers: Church, God 2 each (less than 1%)
Write-in answers: Family and friends, non-profit organizations, 
family and friends, none, people 1 each (less than 1%)
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Educational Attainment
Many immigrants and refugees move to the U.S. after completing education or other significant professional 
experiences in their countries of origin. Due to professional license or educational requirements for professions 
in the U.S., many foreign-educated immigrants and refugees are unable to utilize their credentials to continue 
work in their careers. Immigrants and refugees facing this challenge may opt to enter into another career 
path, complete another educational degree in a U.S. institution, or work to re-enter their careers in an 
alternative, informed way. Data collection regarding both foreign education and U.S. education is an 
important tool to inform community involvement in breaking down barriers for foreign-trained immigrants 
and refugees.

Educational Attainment in Country of Origin	
Because many of Lincoln’s immigrants and refugees came to the U.S. as adults, they often completed 
education abroad. Nearly 1 in 5 (19%) report having a bachelor’s degree or higher. In particular, 
respondents provided information on their highest level of education completed in their home country. 
Thirty-seven percent have less than a high school diploma, 33% have a high school diploma or equivalent, 
6% attended trade school, 5% received an associate degree, 12% received a bachelor’s degree or equivalent 
and 7% received a graduate degree or equivalent. No significant differences were found between education 
received abroad and age, country of origin, gender or years in Lincoln or years in the U.S.

FIGURE 19
(N=481)

7+12+5+6+33+37
Graduate degree

7%

Bachelors degree
or equivalent

12%

Associates degree
or equivalent

5%

High school degree 
or diploma

33%

Trade school
(vocational training, 

certifications, 
apprenticeships) 

6%

Less than high 
school degree
37%
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Of respondents, 61% have not yet achieved a credential in the U.S., 17% have not yet earned their high 
school diploma, 6% have earned their high school diploma, 5% have attended some college but not yet 
graduated, 4% have earned their associate degree, 3% have earned a graduate degree and 3% have earned 
a trade school degree. 

United States Educational Attainment in Relation to Number of Years Living in the U.S.
When looking at U. S. educational attainment and age, country of origin, gender, and years in Lincoln, no 
significant differences were found. A positive, significant difference was found between U.S. educational 
attainment and years in the U.S. Not surprisingly, results indicate that the longer immigrants and refugees 
are living in the United States, the greater quantity of education that they will complete in the U.S.

FIGURE 21
(N=154)

U.S. Educational Attainment Mean (1 - 0-3 years; 2 - 3-5 years; 3 - 5-10 
years; 4 - 10-15 years; 5 - 15 or more years)

Less than high school 2.79 (n=68)
High school degree/diploma 3.70 (n=23)
Some college but no degree 3.20 (n=20)
Trade School 3.80 (n=10)
Associate degree 3.73 (n=15)
Bachelor’s degree or equivalent 4.0 (n=4)
Graduate degree 2.86 (n=14)

Education Attainment after Arriving in the U.S.
Respondents provided information on their highest level of education completed in the U.S. 

FIGURE 20
(N=448)

3+2+4+3+5+6+17+60Less than high school
17%

None
61%

Graduate degree
3%Bachelors degree

2%
Associates degree

4%

High school degree 
6%

Some college, 
but no degree

5%

Trade school
(vocational training, 

certifications, 
apprenticeships) 

3%
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Current Paid Employment
Respondents reported whether they are currently working for pay. Responses indicate that 57% are 
working for pay, while 43% are not. Results collected in this survey are somewhat lower than statistically 
significant data collected by the U.S. Census Bureau’s American Community Survey, which indicated that 
72% of foreign-born adults living in Nebraska were employed in 2017, at least three points higher than 
the employment rate of U.S.– born Nebraskans. No significant differences were found comparing paid 
employment by age, country of origin, gender, years in Lincoln or years in the U.S.

FIGURE 22
(N=487)

  3“State Workforce Data - NE.” Migrationpolicy.org, Migration Policy Institute, 2019, migrationpolicy.org/data/state-profiles/state/workforce/NE.

Current Part-Time or Full-Time Work Schedule
Among respondents who were employed, two-thirds (70%) reported working full-time, with the remainder 
working part-time. No significant differences were found comparing part-time or full-time work schedules 
to age, country of origin, gender, or years in Lincoln. A significant difference was found when comparing to 
years lived in the U.S. The results indicate that people who work full-time report being in the U.S. longer 
than people who are employed part-time.  

FIGURE 23
(N=289)

30+70Part-time
30%

Full-time
70%

43+57No
43%

Yes
57%

If yes, do you work 
full-time or part-time?

Are you employed 
(for pay)?
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Ability to Pay Monthly Expenses
Respondents described whether or not they are able to pay for their monthly needs with 225 (47%) reporting 
that they are always able to pay their monthly expenses, 105 (22%) reporting often, 116 (24%) reporting 
sometimes, and 36 (8%) reporting never. No significant differences were found when comparing ability 
to pay expenses to age, country of origin, gender, years in Lincoln or years in the U.S. The results indicate 
the continued need to remove barriers immigrants and refugees face in achieving career and financial stability. 

FIGURE 24
(N=482)

Underemployment Among Immigrants and Refugees
Among people who are working, under-employment can be a significant challenge. Underemployment 
takes many forms, including involuntary part-time status. Respondents included 80% who reported that 
they currently work part-time and would like to work full-time. Only 20% of respondents stated that they 
do not want to work full-time. Some common reasons for voluntary part-time work is to accommodate 
family obligations, which often includes providing care for school-age children.

FIGURE 25
(N=379)

No significant differences were found when comparing desire to work full-time by country of origin or 
gender. A marginal difference was found according to years lived in Lincoln. Results indicate that people 
who have been in Lincoln longer than people who have just arrived have a higher likelihood of wanting 
to work full-time. A significant difference was also found between desire to work full-time and age. 
Respondents who indicated that they want to work full-time are in a younger age-range category than 
those that said they do not want to work full-time.
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Educational Displacement
Despite the international credentials and professional experience that many immigrants bring to Lincoln, 
a different type of underemployment is also common. This is the “educational displacement” in which 
they are not working in fields that draw on their education and expertise.  Respondents reported whether 
or not they currently work in their field of training/experience. Nearly 60% of respondents, (58%), 
reported that they do not work in their field of training/expertise and would like to do so, while 34% 
did not have training/expertise and 8% reported that they do not want to work in their original field of 
training/expertise.

FIGURE 26
(N=449)

No significant relationships were found when comparing desire to work in the respondents’ prior fields 
of training in relation to country of origin, gender, years in Lincoln and years in the United States. 
A statistically significant relationship was found when comparing age and desire to work in prior field 
of training/experience, with younger respondents maintaining a higher frequency of reporting that 
they wanted to work full-time in their field.

Barriers to Working in Former Careers
For many immigrants and refugees seeking to re-enter their former careers, several potential barriers pose 
a challenge to working in their original fields. In Lincoln, of survey respondents who indicated having a 
prior field of training, 41% reported that there are barriers that prevent working in their field of training.

FIGURE 27
(N=450)

If you do not work 
in your field of 
training/education, 
would you like to 
in the future?

Are there barriers 
that prevent you from 
working in your field 
of training (ex. your 
degree doesn’t 
transfer to the US)?
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Barriers to Full-Time Employment

FIGURE 28
(N=40)

Barrier Number of Respondents
Health (self or care-giving for family) 15
Family Responsibilities 11
Retired/Age 6
Other 3
Need to maintain full-time employment above 
prioritizing professional development 6

Currently a student 1

Health
Respondents reported whether or not they regularly see a primary care provider and/or doctor. Seventy-nine 
percent of respondents reported that they regularly see a primary care provider and/or doctor and 21% 
report that they do not. 

FIGURE 29
(N=490)

No significant differences were found when comparing the likelihood of having a primary care provider and 
country of origin, gender, years in Lincoln or years in the U.S. People who are older report having a primary 
care provider more often than younger people.

22+78No
21%

Yes
79%

Do you have a 
primary care 
provider or doctor 
that you see on 
a regular basis?
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Health Interpretation Availability
Respondents reported on the availability of language interpretation for health services. Sixty-seven percent 
of respondents reported that language interpretation services are available, 19% stated that they are not 
available, and 14% indicated they did not need interpretation services. With one-fifth of respondents 
reporting that interpretation services are not available, there is an opportunity for improvement to provide 
additional information and resources regarding health interpretation in the Lincoln community.

No significant differences were found when comparing health interpretation availability in relation to  
age, country of origin, gender or years in Lincoln. A marginal difference was found between health 
interpretation availability and years in the U.S. People who have been in the U.S. longer reported that 
health interpretation services were marginally less available than people who have been in the U.S. for 
a shorter amount of time.

FIGURE 30
(N=476)

Communication with Doctors
Just over two-thirds (70%) of respondents stated that they are able to understand and communicate 
comfortably with their doctor(s). This means that 30% reported that they could not communicate comfortably, 
and this is an opportunity to improve services in the health care setting. No significant difference was 
found when comparing communication with doctors by age, country of origin or gender. A significant 
relationship was found regarding comfort in communication with a doctor and years in Lincoln. People 
who report that they are comfortable with their doctor are more likely to have been in Lincoln for less time 
than people who report that they are not comfortable in communication with their doctor. This may be due 
in part to additional support available to certain demographics of immigrants and refugees who have 
recently arrived in the U.S., such as the support of a caseworker or in-person interpreter from a similar 
cultural background. 

FIGURE 31
(N=478)
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Transportation for Health Appointments
Nearly 90% of respondents reported using their car to attend doctor appointments. Twenty percent of 
respondents reported riding with a family/friend, 6% utilized the bus, 2% received transportation from a 
caseworker, 1% utilized IntelliRide,4 and one each utilized a taxi or Uber/Lyft. Respondents were able to 
select multiple answers.

FIGURE 32
(N=478)

Type of transportation for health appointments
(Respondents were able to select multiple answers) Percentage

Car 88%
Family/Friend 20%
Bus 6%
Case worker 2%
IntelliRide 1%
Taxi/Uber/Lyft 1%

Support for Emotional Challenges
Respondents reported on the availability of a person that they could talk with if they needed emotional 
support. This question provides insight into both actual and perceived social isolation in the immigrant and 
refugee community. A significant barrier both personally and economically, isolation can not only prevent 
community members from putting down roots and investing in their ties to the community, but it can also 
have tremendous costs regarding mental health, professional development and resilience. 

Eighty-four percent of immigrants and refugees reported having someone to talk to if they are sad compared 
to 16% who reported that they do not.

FIGURE 33
(N=479)

20+80No
16%

Yes
84%

If you are sad or 
worried about 
something, do you 
have someone to 
talk to?

 4IntelliRide is a medical appointment transportation service provider, see http://www.iridenow.com/Home/Nebraska.aspx.
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Who Respondents to Talk to for Emotional Support
When asked about the people that they talk with when in need of emotional support, respondents cited 
friends or family members in the US, friends or family members in their countries of origin, faith/religious 
leaders, community leaders, medical providers and/or support groups. Respondents were able to select 
multiple answers for this question. 

FIGURE 34
(N=408)

If yes, who do you talk to? (Respondents were 
able to select multiple answers) Percentage

Friend or family member in the US 63%
Friend or family member in home country 37%
Faith/religious leader 12%
Medical provider 7%
Community leader 7%
Support group 4%
Write-in answers: Family member, support group, spouse, 
caseworker, prayer 1%

No significant differences were found when comparing the likelihood of having someone to talk to for 
emotional support when compared to age, country of origin or years in Lincoln. 

Significant differences were found when comparing results to gender and years in the U.S. Fifty-seven 
percent of females reported having someone to talk to when they are sad compared to 43% of males. 
The difference is significant (.054). This finding is complementary to results found in U.S.-born adults, 
indicating that women are more likely to have social networks and support systems than men.5

When comparing the number of years in the U.S. to the likelihood of having someone to talk to, people 
were more likely to report that they have someone to talk to if they have lived in the U.S. for a shorter time 
than those that have been in the U.S. for longer. The mean result, 3.35 (n=75), who said that they do not 
have someone to talk to, have been in the U.S. for 5-10 years. This outcome is concerning and suggests the 
need for further studies and investigation. Further, these results also indicate the need for additional outreach 
to immigrants and refugees that have been in the U.S. for longer periods of time with the provision of 
referrals for resources for counseling and other support available in the community.

5Moore, Gwen. “Structural Determinants of Mens and Womens Personal Networks.” American Sociological Review, vol. 55, no. 5, 1990,
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Housing Quality
Nearly 80% of respondents reported that the quality of their housing is safe and comfortable or very safe 
and very comfortable, 11% reported that their housing was safe but not comfortable and 6% reported that 
their housing is somewhat unsafe. Fourteen respondents, or 6%, reported that their housing is very unsafe. 
No significant differences were found comparing housing quality by age, gender, country of origin or time 
in Lincoln or the U.S.

FIGURE 35
(N=472)

Housing Information Requested
Respondents indicated what information about housing that they would like to know more about, 
including: home ownership, RentWise6 classes, tenant rights, financial information and fire/home safety. 
Respondents were able to select multiple options.

FIGURE 36
(N=395)

What if anything, would you be interested in 
learning about housing? (Respondents were 
able to select multiple answers)

Count and Percentage

Home ownership 52%
Fire/home safety 37%
Financial information 35%
RentWise classes 29%
Tenant rights 32%
None <1%

In addition, several respondents provided answers in the comments section including: How to build credit – 
I need to a buy a home in the future; yard care; please print pamphlet that teaches about housing; rent 
methods; home buying information in native language; information on building homes; home interior 
architecture; and real estate in general.

10+20+4+6+60
11%

61%
3%

20%

6%

How do you feel about the 
quality of your housing?

61% My housing is safe and comfortable

11% My housing is safe but not comfortable 
(too small, dirty, etc.)

20% My housing is great! It’s very safe 
and very comfortable

3% My housing is very unsafe (ex. gas leaks, 
rodent and insect infestations, dangerous 
neighbors). I fear for the health and safety 
of myself and my family

6% My housing is somewhat unsafe.

6Nebraska RentWise is a program to help renters obtain and keep rental housing and to be successful renters through education, see rentwise.org.
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Resolving a Housing Problem
Respondents provided information on who they would talk with in order to resolve a housing problem. 
Respondents were able to check multiple options for this question. Fifty-five percent of respondents 
indicated that they would talk to their landlord/housing provider, followed by 41% that would talk with 
a friend or family member. This could be indicative of a cultural or language preference where the tenant 
enlists a friend or family member to translate or provide support. 

FIGURE 37
(N=429)

If you need to solve a housing problem, who 
do you talk to? (Respondents were able to 
select multiple answers)

Percentage

Landlord 55%
Family/friend 41%
Community agency 19%
Caseworker 17%
Teacher or school 4%
Other 2%

How Immigrants and Refugees Receive News
Respondents provided information on how they receive news in the community. Most commonly, immigrants 
and refugees receive their news from family/friends, social media, and television. Respondents were able 
to select multiple options for this question. 

FIGURE 38
(N=473)

How do you receive news? (Respondents were 
able to select multiple answers) Percentage

Family/friend 61%
Social media 53%
Television 45%
Radio 26%
Community center 24%
School teacher 22%
Newspaper 19%
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Volunteer Experience
Of respondents, 42% of immigrants and refugees reported having volunteered or provided voluntary 
community service for no pay compared to 58% who stated that they have not volunteered. This is an 
opportunity to increase awareness of and connection to volunteer opportunities at the neighborhood and 
community levels. Volunteering and community engagement is one critical method to build social capital, 
the networks of social relationships maintained by an individual. In particular, “bonding social capital is 
within a group or community whereas bridging social capital is between social groups, social class, race, 
religion or other important socio demographic or socioeconomic characteristics.”7 Volunteering and 
community engagement creates opportunities for community members to bridge social capital and 
develop relationships with other groups, an important component of integration within a community. 

FIGURE 39
(N=471)

Where Respondents Volunteer
Of those that reported volunteering (n=214), the most common places for volunteering activities were civic 
or community organizations involved in health or social services and religious groups.

FIGURE 40
(N=214)

If yes, where? (Respondents were able to 
select multiple answers) Percentage

Civic or community organization involved in health or 
social services 49%

Religious group 44%
An organization for youth or children 25%
Environmental organization 14%
Sports or coaching 7%

  7Putnam, Robert D. BOWLING ALONE: The Collapse and Revival of American Community. Simon and Schuster, 2020.

Have you volunteered 
or done any voluntary 
community service 
for no pay? 42+58 No

58%

Yes
42%
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Expressing Opinion in the Community
Respondents reported their experiences of sharing their opinion in the community through media and 
with elected officials. Forty immigrants and refugees indicated that they had not contacted anyone to 
share their opinion while 39 reported contacting television, 32 reported contacting local government, 
29 reported contacting radio and 27 contacting reported newspaper.

FIGURE 41
(N=169)

Have you ever contacted any of the following to 
express your opinion on an issue? (Respondents 
were able to select multiple answers)

Percentage

Television 23%
Local government 19%
Radio 17%
Newspaper 16%
No 17%
Write-in (varies) 8%

One respondent said that they had contacted their Congressperson.
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Voting History
Respondents who self-identified as being a registered voter or being eligible to register to vote were 
asked to respond to additional questions regarding voting behavior in Lincoln and the U.S. as a whole. 
Respondents who self-identified as being unable to vote or being unsure if they were able to vote were 
not asked these questions and were not invited to complete the remainder of the survey questions. 

Respondents indicated whether or not they are currently eligible to vote. In total, 36% of respondents 
indicated that they are eligible and are either currently registered or not currently registered. Sixty-four 
percent of respondents indicated that they are either not eligible to vote or did not know if they were 
eligible. The results indicate an opportunity for work to be done educating immigrants and refugees 
about their right to vote, how to register and educating people on issues.

FIGURE 42: CURRENT ELIGIBILITY TO VOTE
(N=505) 

Statistically significant differences were found when comparing voter registration eligibility and age, 
gender, years in Lincoln and years in the U.S. Older respondents reported a higher rate of voting at their 
current address than younger people.
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Gender and Voting Knowledge
There were notable differences among men and women when it came to their awareness of voting 
eligibility and their current voter registration status. Statistical analysis of voter registration eligibility and 
gender shows a discrepancy between male and female voter registration. Nearly 22% of females who 
responded to the questions said they were currently registered to vote, while 28% of males said they 
were currently registered. Respondents also indicated a significant difference in voting eligibility awareness 
and current registration. More than one-fifth, 20%, of females said they did not know if they were eligible 
compared to only 11% of men who said that they did not know if they were eligible to vote. This survey 
did not delve into the reasons behind these discrepancies, which could be driven by differences in 
English language ability or other factors that are correlated with characteristics such as U.S. citizenship 
or voting behavior. 

Years in U.S. and Voting
There is a significant relationship between the number of years living in the U.S. and whether an immigrant 
or refugee is registered to vote. People who have lived in the U.S. longer are more likely to be registered 
to vote.

FIGURE 43
(N=505) 

Registered voter at current address?
Mean (Years in U.S.: 1 – 0-3 years; 
2 – 3-5 years; 3 – 5-10 years; 
4 – 10-15 years; 5-15 or more years) 

I’m currently a registered voter 24% (n=122)
I’m not registered to vote but I’m eligible to register 12% (n=62)
I am not eligible to vote 17% (n=85)
I don’t know if I am eligible 47% (n=236)

28
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Voting in Lincoln
Respondents were asked whether they had voted in an election since coming to live in Lincoln, with 52% of 
respondents reporting voting in Lincoln and 48% reporting not voting. 

FIGURE 44
(N=178) 

Significant differences were found comparing voting in Lincoln by age but no differences were found 
compared to gender or years in Lincoln. Older refugees and immigrants reported voting significantly 
more than younger refugees and immigrants.

Voting Frequency
When asked how often they vote in elections, immigrants and refugees provided a mixed response. The 
highest number of respondents reported never voting followed by voting every four years. Only 35 people 
voted every year.8

FIGURE 45
(N=174) 
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Voting Frequency in Relation to Age
When looking at age, young respondents vote significantly less than older immigrants and refugees that 
completed the survey. This trend is consistent with data collected from voting rates of U.S.-born residents.9

FIGURE 46
(N=174) 

How often do you vote? Mean (Years in US: 1 - 0-3 years; 2 - 3-5 years; 
3 - 5-10 years; 4 - 10-15 years; 5 - 15 or more years) 

Never 3.90 (n=61)
Rarely 3.26 (n=19)
Every four years 4.18 (n=44)
Every two years 4.13 (n=15)
Every year 5.03 (n=35)
TOTAL 4.15 (n=174)

No significant differences were found comparing voting and country of origin.

Information about Voting
Respondents feel confident that they have the information needed to vote in federal, state, and local elections 
as 66% of respondents reported confidence in their information needed to vote. Younger respondents 
reported having less information about voting compared to older respondents.

FIGURE 47
(N=172) 

Do you feel that you 
have the information 
you need to vote in 
local, state and/or 
federal elections? 66+34 Yes

66%

No
34%

Table of Contents



31

Whether Respondents Feel They Have the Information Needed to Vote in Relation 
to Years Lived in U.S.

FIGURE 48
(N=172) 

Feel like you have information 
you need to vote

Years in U.S. (1 – 0-3 years; 2 – 3-5 years; 
3 – 5-10 years; 4 – 10-15 years; 5-15 or more years) 

No 3.83 (n=59)
Yes 4.24 (n=113)
TOTAL 4.10 (n=172)

Confidence Navigating U.S. Voting Processes
Respondents were also asked about their confidence in their own civic knowledge on topics such as 
registering to vote, understanding elections and voting by mail. Only 27% of respondents reported 
confidence in registering to vote. Twenty-two percent expressed confidence in going to their polling station 
and only 15% reported confidence in voting by mail. In terms of information, 7% expressed confidence in 
accessing and understanding ballot issues and 11% expressed confidence in accessing and understanding 
candidate information. Only 8% expressed confidence in an understanding of elected officials’ positions on 
issues. This data suggests a need for the Lincoln community to invest in additional resources and information 
for immigrant and refugee community members to engage confidently with elections and voting.  

FIGURE 49
(N=289) 

18+9+8+20+26+9+10
An understanding of elected 
officials’ positions on issues
8%

Going to your polling station
22%

Accessing and 
understanding ballot issues
7%

Accessing and understanding 
candidate information

11%
Registering to vote
27%

Voting by mail
15%

None of the above
10%
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Conclusion
Leading the Pack? Lincoln’s Findings in Light of its Competitors
Lincoln stacks up well next to many cities with comparable characteristics, but several are making headway 
on immigration and related economic and social inclusion issues. Most notably, Salt Lake City (and its 
associated County) have funded a staff position dedicated to immigrant and refugee issues. Des Moines 
was a fellow winner (alongside Lincoln) of the WES Skilled Immigrant Integration Program and has moved 
ambitiously to pull together diverse civic and government partners under the leadership of its Chamber of 
Commerce. Madison, which like Lincoln is a state capital, college town and mid-sized city, has made robust  
investments in its Human Rights workforce.

Lincoln/Lancaster County can take the lead by investing in proven models that address 
issues identified in its 2019 New Americans Task Force Immigrant and Refugee Survey by:

	 ● Ensuring sustainable funding and institutionalized policies will endure across administrations.

	 ● Investing in the implementation of a My City Academy program, which will capitalize on immigrant 	
		  and refugee community members’ trust in civic institutions to build a corps of ambassadors who can 	
		  educate and connect advocates within their cultural communities.

	 ● Supporting a Professional Connector program can help foster support networks for immigrant and 	
		  refugees and tackle issues of under-employment.
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The following organizations invested in the creation of the survey:
Asian Community & Cultural Center
Catholic Social Services
Lutheran Family Services
LPS Bilingual Liaisons
Nebraska Appleseed
Civic Nebraska
El Centro de las Américas
Yazidi Cultural Center

The following individuals completed data analysis or supported creation 
of the report:
Dr. Janell Walther, University of Nebraska Public Policy Center
Heather Engdahl, Nebraska Appleseed
Jeannie Mutum, Lincoln Partnership for Economic Development 
Amanda Bergson-Shilcock, National Skills Coalition
 
Sponsorship - agencies that provided leadership and/or financial support 
Asian Community & Cultural Center - Lee Kreimer and Sheila Dorsey Vinton
Lancaster County - Sara Hoyle
City of Lincoln - Adelle Burke, Mindy Rush Chipman, Francisca Beltran
Lincoln Partnership for Economic Development - Bryan Seck
Civic Nebraska - José Lemus 
Nebraska Appleseed - Christa Yoakum 
Lutheran Family Services - Marni Newell, Bashar Karim and Haefaa Hasan
Catholic Social Services - Katie Patrick, Carmen Lopez and Drew Miller
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New Americans Task Force 
Survey Data Report



2019 NATF Survey Development

- Goal of survey: collect input from immigrants and 
refugees in Lincoln about English access, health and 
wellness, social spaces and local infrastructure, civic 
engagement, employment, and housing

- Survey questions and content reviewed by:
- NATF partner organizations, including cultural 

centers 
- LPS bilingual liaisons
- Lincoln ethnic-based community organizations

- Survey translated into Karen, Spanish, Vietnamese, 
and Arabic 



2019 NATF Survey Sample
- Qualifying requirements for survey participation:

- 18+ years old
- Self-identification as immigrant or refugee

- Sample size: 505 participants recruited on paper and virtually through:
- NATF partner organizations
- Faith-based communities
- Retail stores
- Online social media platforms
- Friends

- All responses was translated [if applicable], sorted, and analyzed using data 
analysis software that allowed for comparisons pertaining to correlations 
between demographic and other information and certain survey responses.



Survey Results



Finding 1: Respondents trust and value Lincoln’s 
public infrastructure 

- 70% indicate a trust in Lincoln’s schools

- 74% attend community events that 

celebrate their own culture

- 68% indicate a trust in police

- 50% utilize and feel welcome at city parks



Finding 2: English acquisition is important to 
immigrants and refugees and their long-term goals 

- Nearly all respondents, 99.8%, agreed or 

strongly agreed that English is important to 

their everyday lives

- 99% of respondents indicated English is 

important to their long-term goals



Finding 3: A majority of respondents have educational and 
professional experience they are not currently utilizing

- 64% of respondents came to the U.S. with a high school degree or 

higher. Of those, 30% have post secondary education but are not 

employed in their field of training.

- Nearly 60% of respondents said they do not currently work in and 

want to return to their professional field of study/expertise.



Finding 4: Respondents experience barriers that 
prevent them from self sufficiency and economic 
mobility  

- 52% of respondents indicated they cannot 

always pay their monthly expenses

- 20% of respondents indicated their housing 

is either unsafe or uncomfortable

- 30% of respondents stated they are unable 

to understand and communicate 

comfortably with their healthcare providers 



Next Steps
- Lincoln/Lancaster County can take the lead by investing in models that 

address barriers presented in the NATF survey, ensuring: 
- Sustainable funding and institutionalized policies will endure across 

administrations. Implementation of long-term goals through the 
development of an integration plan can provide a road map. 

- Continued support of NATF’s CareerLadder, which seeks to provide tools 
for skilled immigrant professionals to re-enter their former careers. 

- Investment in the social capital of immigrants through MyCity Academy, 
which will build upon New Americans’ trust in local institutions to build a 
corps of ambassadors who can educate and connect advocates within 
their cultural communities.



Thank you!



Lancaster County ‐ Nebraska
Budget ‐ Proposed
F20 vs F21
as of: 6/30/20

EXPENSES REVENUES

Department Description FY20 Budget FY21 Budget $ Diff Inc/(Dec)  % Diff Inc/(Dec)  Department Description FY20 Budget FY21 Budget $ Diff Inc/(Dec)  % Diff Inc/(Dec) 

6010 ‐ Board of Commissioners 331,153$                 333,276$                 2,123$                 0.64% 6020 ‐ County Clerk 84,900$                  84,900$                  ‐$                     0.00%
6020 ‐ County Clerk 1,388,461$              1,465,032$              76,571$               5.51% 603 ‐ County Treasurer 7,400,050$             7,370,120$             (29,930)$              ‐0.40%
603 ‐ County Treasurer 3,624,015$              3,774,780$              150,765$             4.16% 6050 ‐ Assessor/Register of Deeds 2,100,000$             2,300,000$             200,000$             9.52%
6050 ‐ Assessor/Register of Deeds 4,502,529$              4,617,963$              115,434$             2.56% 6060 ‐ ROD Technology 200,000$                230,000$                30,000$               15.00%
6060 ‐ ROD Technology 219,450$                 228,250$                 8,800$                 4.01% 6070 ‐ Election Commissioner 52,850$                  451,650$                398,800$             754.59%
6070 ‐ Election Commissioner 1,636,744$              1,689,470$              52,726$               3.22% 610 ‐ Information Services 10,656$                  10,656$                  ‐$                     0.00%
610 ‐ Information Services 1,699,600$              1,267,275$              (432,325)$            ‐25.44% 6110 ‐ Budget & Fiscal 26,245$                  29,510$                  3,265$                 12.44%
6110 ‐ Budget & Fiscal 295,146$                 294,853$                 (293)$                   ‐0.10% 6120 ‐ General Government 95,000$                  95,000$                  ‐$                     0.00%
6120 ‐ General Government 17,542,051$            21,645,221$            4,103,170$          23.39% 6210 ‐ Clerk of the District Court 440,000$                440,000$                ‐$                     0.00%
6130 ‐ Administrative Services 611,333$                 583,224$                 (28,109)$              ‐4.60% 6220 ‐ County Court 41,100$                  46,600$                  5,500$                 13.38%
6180 ‐ Board of Equalization 447,120$                 359,163$                 (87,957)$              ‐19.67% 6230 ‐ Juvenile Court ‐$                         ‐$                         ‐$                     0.00%
6210 ‐ Clerk of the District Court 1,981,080$              2,014,267$              33,187$               1.68% 624 ‐ District Court 249,750$                255,250$                5,500$                 2.20%
6220 ‐ County Court 1,735,497$              1,579,212$              (156,285)$            ‐9.01% 625 ‐ Public Defender 473,732$                497,419$                23,687$               5.00%
6230 ‐ Juvenile Court 2,083,019$              2,178,543$              95,524$               4.59% 645 ‐ Extension Service 5,500$                    5,500$                    ‐$                     0.00%
624 ‐ District Court 2,881,916$              3,109,213$              227,297$             7.89% 6480 ‐ Records Management 84,100$                  95,600$                  11,500$               13.67%
625 ‐ Public Defender 4,970,026$              5,284,090$              314,064$             6.32% 6510 ‐ County Sheriff 2,120,696$             2,134,221$             13,525$               0.64%
6270 ‐ Jury Commissioner 413,320$                 426,940$                 13,620$               3.30% 652 ‐ County Attorney 1,591,386$             1,451,000$             (140,386)$            ‐8.82%
6280 ‐ Justice Miscellaneous 1,987,829$              1,553,295$              (434,534)$            ‐21.86% 671 ‐ Corrections 749,000$                773,000$                24,000$               3.20%
645 ‐ Extension Service 1,004,352$              1,012,393$              8,041$                 0.80% 676 ‐ Community Corrections 1,666,421$             1,711,939$             45,518$               2.73%
6480 ‐ Records Management 670,321$                 699,666$                 29,345$               4.38% 678 ‐ Youth Services Center 2,386,812$             2,452,190$             65,378$               2.74%
6510 ‐ County Sheriff 13,739,205$            14,639,869$            900,664$             6.56% 6931 ‐ Emergency Management Svs 349,215$                365,088$                15,873$               4.55%
652 ‐ County Attorney 8,779,112$              9,038,510$              259,398$             2.95% 8010 ‐ General Assistance 250,000$                202,800$                (47,200)$              ‐18.88%
671 ‐ Corrections 26,508,310$            28,619,749$            2,111,439$          7.97% 8370 ‐ Human Services 476,426$                501,407$                24,981$               5.24%
673 ‐ Juvenile Probation 326,613$                 319,126$                 (7,487)$                ‐2.29% 9999 ‐ General Fund General 99,546,880$           98,356,181$           (1,190,699)$        ‐1.20%
6740 ‐ Adult Probation 577,500$                 576,175$                 (1,325)$                ‐0.23%
676 ‐ Community Corrections 3,431,029$              3,628,400$              197,371$             5.75% Grand Total 120,400,719$        119,860,031$        (540,688)$           ‐0.45%
678 ‐ Youth Services Center 5,271,313$              5,182,388$              (88,925)$              ‐1.69%
6931 ‐ Emergency Management Svs 578,431$                 610,175$                 31,744$               5.49%
7030 ‐ County Engineer 4,300,892$              4,478,712$              177,820$             4.13%
7510 ‐ Mental Health Board 149,566$                 158,155$                 8,589$                 5.74%
8010 ‐ General Assistance 2,213,000$              1,242,425$              (970,575)$            ‐43.86%
8030 ‐ Veterans Administration 355,622$                 380,929$                 25,307$               7.12%
8040 ‐ G.A. Operating 453,174$                 145,585$                 (307,589)$            ‐67.87%
8050 ‐ Health & Human Services 5,171,964$              5,342,179$              170,215$             3.29%
8370 ‐ Human Services 794,327$                 901,595$                 107,268$             13.50%

Grand Total 122,675,020$         129,380,096$         6,705,076$         5.47%

6/30/2020



From: Candice Wooster
To: Kerry P. Eagan; David A. Derbin
Subject: Wooster, C. - Letter to County Board Regarding Late Fees
Date: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 2:28:25 PM
Attachments: Letter to Lancaster County Board re Fees - 06-24-2020.pdf

[CAUTION] This email comes from a sender outside your organization.

Mr. Eagan and Mr. Derbin,
 
Attached is the requested letter regarding the late submission of my Juvenile Court fees in
Lancaster County. If you have any further questions or need additional information or
character letters, then please let me know. Thank you for the opportunity to provide you this
information in advance.
 
 
Sincerely,
Candice
 
Candice C. Wooster
Brennan, Nielsen, & Wooster Law Offices
610 J Street, Suite 200
Lincoln, NE  68508
Phone: 402-441-4848
Fax: 402-441-4840
candice@brennannielsenlaw.com
 
This electronic mail and any attached documents are intended solely for the named addressee(s) and
contain confidential information. If you are not an addressee, or responsible for delivering this email
to an addressee, you have received this email in error and are notified that reading, copying, or
disclosing this email is prohibited. If you received this email in error, immediately reply to the sender
and delete the message completely from your computer system.
 
 

mailto:candice@brennannielsenlaw.com
mailto:KEagan@lancaster.ne.gov
mailto:DDerbin@lancaster.ne.gov
mailto:candice@brennannielsenlaw.com















LANCASTER COUNTY CLERK

County-City Building | 555 South 10th Street | Lincoln, NE 68508-2803

402-441-7484 | Fax 402-441-8728

DAN NOLTE

Clerk

June 25, 2020

Theresa Emmert

Juvenile Court Administrator

Re: Claim(s) to be reviewed by the Lancaster County Board of Commissioners

Dear Theresa:

The Lancaster County Board of Commissioners will be reviewing the following claim(s) on
Thursday, July 2, 2020, during the County Board Staff Meeting in Room 112 (Chambers), on the
first floor of the County-City Building:

A. Vouchers 689124 thru 689136 on batch 255811 to Attorney Candice Wooster,
dated June 24,2020 for a total of $19,388.30. These claims include billing for
services performed in 2018 and 2019. These claims are beyond the 90-day
time period (see Neb. Rev. Stat. §23-135).

23-135. Claims; time of filing; approval of certain purchases; procedure; payment in

advance of services; authorized; disallowance of claim; notice; appeal.

1. (1) All claims against a county shall be filed with the county clerk within ninety days
from the time when any materials or labor, which form the basis of the claims, have been

furnished or performed, except that (a) the fees of jurors serving in the district courts

shall be paid as provided for in section 23-131, (b) payment may be approved as provided
in subsection (2) of this section, and (c) payments may be made as provided in subsection
(3) of this section. The county board may authorize procedures whereby claims may be
filed electronically. The electronic filing shall include the following: Information with
respect to the person filing the claim, the basis of the claim, the amount of the claim, the

date of the claim, and any other information the county board may require. The county
clerk shall keep records of each electronic claim. The records shall be accessible for

public viewing in either electronic or printed format.

Any additional documentation to support your claim may be submitted to the County Clerk's

office or if you wish to appear and/or provide additional clarification regarding this claim(s) on
July 2, 2020, please contact Ann Ames in the County Board Office, so she can schedule a

specific time.



Sincerely,

QaffNolte
County Clerk'sj Office

Email: Dave Derbin, County Board Office
Arm Ames, County Board Office

Danielle Buck, County Board Office
Kevin Nelson, County Clerk's Office









Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765

Voucher: Status: Paid06/23/202034765

Case ID: JV16-314Docket: Client: Asencio, Haiden6686

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $65.00 12/20/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Continuing Temporary Legal Custody with the Nebraska Department of Health and Human Services; Order Approving Placement Change; Order Approving and Modifying Plan; Order Setting Review and Permanency HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 12/21/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail fril E. Strickland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/08/2019 0.80 $52.00$65.00

Review PDI and Treatment Update; E-mail to parties (1), M. Carraher (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Carraher (2)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/09/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Attend hearing (JV18-63)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/10/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Juvenile on Probation; Order Setting Review Hearing (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1); E-mail to K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/15/2019 0.55 $35.75$65.00

Attend treatment team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/15/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (2), M. Martin (1), A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (2); E-mail to E. Strickland (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/16/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1); E-mail to K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/17/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/18/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/11/2019 0.45 $29.25$65.00

E-mail to A. Feit (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (3), A. Feit (3), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/12/2019 0.55 $35.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (4), M. Kirk (2), M. Molina (2), K. Morrow (2); E-mail to A. Feit (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/12/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

Attend team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/13/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Page: 1 of 69 34765Voucher:06/23/2020



Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/14/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Motion to Revoke Probation (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/15/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Appointing Guardian ad Litem (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/15/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel for MTRP (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/15/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order for Immediate Custody (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/18/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (2); E-mail to E. Strickland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/18/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Review fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/19/2019 0.60 $39.00$65.00

Attend treatment team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/19/2019 0.75 $48.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (2), A. Feit (4), E. Strickland (3), M. Kirk (3); E-mail to A. Feit (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/20/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review Motion to Withdraw and e-mail from M. Carraher (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/20/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order for Transport (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/20/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Allowing Public Defender to Withdraw and Appointing Counsel (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/20/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Rockhill (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/21/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/21/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Review discharge summaryNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/22/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/26/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Molina (1), A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Review PDINote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Motion for Emergency Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/01/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Regarding Detention Hearing (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/01/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Denial; Order Setting Motion to Revoke Probation for Formal Hearing (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/01/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Canceling Immediate Custody (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/04/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/04/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Aproving Emergency Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/05/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Review file; e-mail to A. Osborn (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Noticing Placement at YRTCNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Motion to Commit to YRTC (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Adjudication of Violation of Probation (JV18-63)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.65 $42.25$65.00

Attend hearing; client meetingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.55 $35.75$65.00

Review PDI; E-mail to M. Molina (2), A. Osborn (1); Receive and reivew e-mail from A. Osborn (2), C. Turner (1), M. Molina (2)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Review and Permanency HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/18/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1) with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/25/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/26/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/27/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Santiago (2), A. Feit (2); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/02/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1), S. Slater (1); E-mail to S. Slater (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/10/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail with attachment from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/17/2019 0.60 $39.00$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 04/30/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/01/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), A. Feit (1), J. Ward (1), K. Morrow (1), T. Menard (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/02/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to T. Menard (1); Review file and complete FCRO questionsNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/02/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Review and Permanency HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/09/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/13/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Call to S. Slater (PO)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/14/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/15/2019 0.80 $52.00$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/27/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Review FCRO ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/06/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/07/2019 1.15 $74.75$65.00

Review CRCP, CASA Report, and FCRO report; Prepare, file, and serve GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/10/2019 0.75 $48.75$65.00

Attend hearing; conference with PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/10/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/12/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/19/2019 0.60 $39.00$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/24/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (2), S. Johnson (1), A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/24/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Attend team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/28/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Carr (2); E-mail to M. Carr (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/01/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Carr (2); E-mail to M. Carr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Page: 4 of 69 34765Voucher:06/23/2020



Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/03/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review Case Plan (YRTC)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/15/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (2); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/15/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Attend PO team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/16/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/18/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Attend PO team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/24/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (4), K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/25/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review email from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/31/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/01/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/13/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail with attachment from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/21/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1), A. Osborn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Attend PO team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to A. Osborn (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/23/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/11/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/11/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Attend team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/24/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/27/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/30/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/01/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Asencio (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 10/07/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/09/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/10/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/23/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/25/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/28/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), S. Slater (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and Review email from S. AsencioNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and Review email from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/05/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), J. Ward (1), C. Turner (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to M. KirkNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

E-mail to M. Kirk (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (3), A. Osborn (1), A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1), C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/02/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/02/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1) Lancaster county District Court (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 12/05/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/16/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1); E-mail to J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/16/2019 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Review CRCP; Prepare, file, and serve GAL reportNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/17/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/17/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/19/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/19/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Attend PO Team Meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), M. Asencio (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/06/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/10/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/24/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/28/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 01/30/2020 0.30 $7.50$25.00

Team Meeting (by phone) (AB for CW)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/13/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Directing Release for Review to the FCRONote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (2), J. Ward (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/26/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/26/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Receive and review from M. Kirk (3), J. Ward (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/30/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (2); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/09/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Attend team meeting (via Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/09/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (3), A. Feit (4), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting Reentry HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/20/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend PO Treatment Team Meeting (by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/20/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Carr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion for Expedited Rentry HearingNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/11/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Overruling Expedited Re-Entry HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/03/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. Judds (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), A. Osborn (1) *Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/03/2020 1.90 $142.50$75.00

Review CRCP, CASA Report, Reentry Plan; Prepare GAL Report; Call with M. KirkNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/04/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend hearing (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 06/04/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

1 email sent/reviewed regarding Haiden Asencio - JV18-63Note:EmailingActivity:

2414.50Total Paid:
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Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/10/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/15/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/16/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/22/2018 1.10 $71.50$65.00

Attend hearing ; conference with partiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/22/2018 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/24/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Setting Further Review Hearing; Interim OrdersNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/25/2018 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/05/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/15/2018 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County District Court (2). T. Vacek (1); E-mail to Lancaster County District Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/15/2018 0.95 $61.75$65.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/16/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Court (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/21/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/26/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Committing Temporary Legal Custody with the Nebraska Department of Health and Human Services with in-home Placement; Order Approving and Modifying Plan; Order Setting Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/26/2018 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/04/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Norrie (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (1), Clinic (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/05/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Norrie (1), J. McNeil (1), R. Kunz (1), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/06/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 02/11/2019 0.60 $39.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Norrie (1), Clinic (3), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (3); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/12/2019 0.95 $61.75$65.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (5), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (7), J. McNeil (3), Clinic (4), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Norrie (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/13/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. McNeil (2), T. Vacek (2), M. Norrie (1), Clinic (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/14/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Norrie (1), T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/15/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Court Order granting continuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/19/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/19/2019 1.00 $65.00$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/03/2019 1.15 $74.75$65.00

Attend hearing; Conference with client and PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/03/2019 1.10 $71.50$65.00

Review CRCP and GAL report; E-mail to GALNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/05/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Committing Temporary Legal Custody with NDHHS with in-home Placement; Order Approving and Modifying Plan; Order Setting Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/11/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/17/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Review update from LFS; E-mail to T. Vacek (2); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review therapist update; E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/14/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), R. Kunz (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/15/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/16/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/27/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/27/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Conference with clientNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/28/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/28/2019 0.45 $29.25$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 08/28/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), J. McNeil (2), M. Paxton (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/30/2019 0.60 $45.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/02/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Helbusch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/04/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Houlden (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/06/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to J. Houlden (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/01/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.95 $71.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/07/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/07/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Continuing Legal Custody with the Nebraska Department of Health and Human Services with in-home placement; Order Approving and Modifying Plan; Order Setting Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/08/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/22/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/23/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/26/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mails from Client (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/04/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to clientNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1), Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), Client (1); E-mail to client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/23/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (2) with attachments (1); T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 11/24/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (2); E-mail to client (1),Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/25/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1); E-mail to client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (2), S. Sabata (1), J. McNeil (2); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 1.60 $120.00$75.00

Attend team meeting; Conference with clientNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/27/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (1), S. Sabata (3), A. Hellbusch (1); E-mail to S. Sabata (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/27/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion for placement changeNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/02/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call to PO K. BaberNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to Withdraw Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), D. Kerr (1), A. Hellbusch (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/03/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with PO K. BaberNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/04/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), A. Hellbusch (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Withdraw Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/04/2019 0.30 $7.50$25.00

Phone call with PO K. Baber; Notes on updatesNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/08/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order to Continue Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/11/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), D. Kerr (1), A. Hellbusch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/12/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Objection to Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 12/12/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review Motion for Change of Placement and AffidavitNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/12/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/13/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting Hearing on the Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/13/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to Withdraw Objection to Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/16/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/17/2019 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend Hearing on Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/23/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order; Notice of Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/06/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and reivew e-mail from A. HellbushNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/07/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and reivew e-mail from A. HellbushNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/16/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek with attachment (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/22/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/22/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/24/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/28/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/28/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to D. Kerr (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), D. Kerr (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/28/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/03/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (2), A. Marx (1), E. Synowicki (1); E-mail to D. Kerr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/05/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (2); E-mail to client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/06/2020 0.55 $41.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from client (5), E. Synowicki (1); E-mail to client (4), E. Synowicki (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/18/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Volmer (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/25/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Conference with J. McNeil and T. VacekNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail fro client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Helbusch (2), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/12/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Helbusch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/13/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/14/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (2), D. Kerr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/15/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.80 $60.00$75.00

E-mail to D. Kerr (1), Client (1), A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (3), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), D. Kerr (1), J. McNeil (2), T. Vacek (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/19/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/10/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1), Client (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to client (1), A. Hellbusch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/13/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to client (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/15/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/16/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/17/2020 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (6), J. McNeil (5), T. Vacek (7); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/18/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 04/20/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/23/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive Draft PPA and Child Support Statement from Mediation CenterNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/23/2020 0.80 $60.00$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/23/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/29/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and Review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (2); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), D. Kerr (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend hearing (via Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/08/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/14/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter 05-14-20Note:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and Review e-mail from client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 10/25/2018 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies (3) 10-25-18Note:Activity:

Postage 10/25/2018 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:
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Postage 11/26/2018 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 11/26/2018 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies (7) 11-26-18Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 04/11/2019 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies (7) 04-11-19Note:Activity:

Postage 04/11/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 10/08/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 10/08/2019 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies (7) 10-7-19Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 12/10/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies (1) 12-10-19Note:Activity:

Postage 12/10/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 01/28/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 01/28/2020 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies (7) 01-28-20Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 03/19/2020 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies (1) 03-19-20Note:Activity:

Postage 03/20/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 05/14/2020 8.00 $0.40$0.05

Photo Copies for 05-14-20 (8)Note:Activity:

Postage 05/14/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

2531.80Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV18-60Docket: Client: Burch, Trever11692

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $65.00 12/26/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/08/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/09/2019 0.85 $55.25$65.00

E-mail to C. Turner (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), J. McNeil (1); Receive and reivew e-mail from C. Turner (2), A. Brown (2), J. McNeil (3), M. Douglass (6), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/10/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/10/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

E-mail to C. Roberts (2), M. Douglass (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Roberts (1), M. Douglass (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/10/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

Prepare, file and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/14/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (2), M. Douglass (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/15/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/18/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/18/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

E-mail to M. Douglass (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1), M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/21/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/22/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 01/31/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/04/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (4), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1); E-mail to M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/07/2019 0.80 $52.00$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/07/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

E-mail to M. Douglass (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/07/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 02/11/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1); E-mail to A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/16/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/20/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/22/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Douglass (2), C. Roberts (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/25/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), C. Turner (1), A. Brown (1), M. Douglass (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/26/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Roberts (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and Review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/27/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/04/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/04/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/07/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/07/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion for VisitationNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/11/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/12/2019 1.15 $74.75$65.00

Review CRCP and GAL report; E-mail to J. Clark (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/12/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Conference with A. BrownNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/13/2019 0.50 $32.50$65.00

Conference with clientNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/13/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

E-mail to J. Clark with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/13/2019 1.65 $107.25$65.00

Attend hearing; client meetingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/14/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to R. McClain (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/18/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 03/18/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/01/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to J. Clark (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/01/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/02/2019 0.70 $45.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (4), L. Jones (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (5); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/03/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/04/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), B. Hunter (3), A. Brown (1), C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/05/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/08/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/10/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Dunham (1), J. Rine (1), B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/11/2019 0.50 $32.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), J. Rine (1), S. Dunham (2), J. Palacios (2), L. Jones (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/17/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/18/2019 0.55 $35.75$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/30/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/01/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), J. Rine (1), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/07/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/20/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/21/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Jones (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/23/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to L. Jones (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/30/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1), O. Faubel (1), C. Turner (1), A. Brown (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 06/12/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/13/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/17/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (4), A. Brown (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/18/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), A. Brown (1), L. Jones (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/24/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/25/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Call to PO, R. BaxterNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/25/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/26/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Call to PO, R. Baxter and K. WoodsNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/02/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to PO, Kristin Woods and PO, Rick BaxterNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/03/2019 0.45 $33.75$75.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (2); Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (5), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1), T. Burch (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/03/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with PO, Kristin WoodsNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. Palacios (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/10/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2), A. Brown (1), K. Wolff (1), M. Madison (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1),Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/11/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1), K. Wolff (1), B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/12/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/15/2019 1.10 $82.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (in person and by phone)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/15/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to client (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/16/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to A. Brown (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 07/18/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1), B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/07/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 08/09/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Conference with C. TurnerNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/16/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (2), H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/19/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/20/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

E-mail to B. Hunter (2), H. Valderstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), H. Valderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/27/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/08/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review GAL ReprtNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/09/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with K. WoodsNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/09/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/09/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend hearing; conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/10/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Vordstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vordstrasse (2), C. Turner (1); J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/12/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to H. Vordstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vordstrasse with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/17/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/19/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/03/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2) with attachment (1), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Conference with J. McNeilNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/22/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1) with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/28/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 11/18/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (2); J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (4); E-mail to J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/23/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/02/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from  H. Vorderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/13/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrassee (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/18/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/26/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1), Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrassee (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/06/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4), Client (4), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/29/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/04/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail with attachment from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/07/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/10/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/18/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Call with clientNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/20/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to C. Turner (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), Client (1); E-mail to client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/24/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to H. Vorderstrassee (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/25/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Vorderstrassee (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Review visitation notesNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Review CRCP; Review visitation notesNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/27/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/28/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Miller with attachments (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/28/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/01/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/02/2020 1.25 $93.75$75.00

Attend hearing (AM for CCW)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/02/2020 1.00 $25.00$25.00

Review visitation notes; Notes to fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/02/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Review fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/04/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/05/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Conference with H. VorderstrasseeNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 03/19/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/26/2020 0.60 $15.00$25.00

Review visitation notes; Notes to fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/30/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call to clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/30/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review H. Vorderstrasse (2), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with H. VorderstrasseNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/06/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

E-mail to Client (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2); Receive and review e-mail from Client (1), H. Vrderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/07/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Miller with attachment (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/10/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/21/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

E-mail to C. Turner (2), Client (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (2), A. Brown (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1), Client (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/21/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call to clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/21/2020 1.05 $78.75$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/30/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

0 Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4) with attachment (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/04/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), J. McNeil (1), Client (1); E-mail to Client (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/11/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/11/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/12/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4), Client (1Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 05/12/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/12/2020 0.60 $45.00$75.00

Call with H. VorderstrasseNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/19/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (4), J. McNeil (5), C. Turner (2), K. Lauenroth (3); E-mail to A. Brown (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/21/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1), K. Lauenroth (1); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/22/2020 0.95 $71.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (8), J. McNeil (6), A. Brown (3), C. Turner (2); E-mail to K. Lauenroth (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to S. Thompson (1), K. Lauenroth (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Thompson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 1.10 $82.50$75.00

Attend team meeting; E-mail to K. Lauenroth (1)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), K. Lauenroth (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/29/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/29/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), K. Boko (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Boko (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter 06-01-20Note:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), C. Turner (2), A. Brown (2), C. Roberts (2), J. McNeil (2), Client (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (4), K. Boko (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.65 $48.75$75.00

Attend hearing (By Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/05/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Transferring Case to Judge WhiteNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/05/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/08/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/08/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to K. Lauenroth (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Page: 26 of 69 34834Voucher:06/23/2020



Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), C. Turner (1), A. Brown (1), J. McNeil (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Postage 02/07/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 03/19/2019 6.00 $0.30$0.05

Photo Copies for 03-18-19 (6)Note:Activity:

Postage 03/19/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 09/19/2019 5.00 $0.25$0.05

Photo Copies for 09-19-19 (5)Note:Activity:

Postage 09/19/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 03/19/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 03/19/2020 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies for 03-19-20 (7)Note:Activity:

Postage 06/01/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

3129.60Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV17-599Docket: Client: Allbright/Erpelding Children12836

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Little (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/30/2019 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/30/2019 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Review CRCP; Draft GAL reportNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/03/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), M. Little (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/05/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from V. Gorden (1), M. Little (1), A. ColemanNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/05/2019 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Review CRCP; Draft GAL report; E-mail to R. Townsend (1)Note:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/06/2019 0.60 $45.00$75.00

Finalize and serve GAL reportNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/06/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to R. Townsend (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/06/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

303.75Total Paid:
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Voucher: Status: Paid06/23/202034870

Case ID: JV19-431Docket: Client: Pilcher, Erica17195

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/07/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Appointing CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/07/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/07/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Open office fileNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/12/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/19/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/21/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1); E-mail to J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/22/2019 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend hearing; client meetingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/09/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/09/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Conference with C. SturgeonNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/12/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile CourtNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/15/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and Review email from J. Ward (1); Email to J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/16/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting Formal HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/16/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/16/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 09/18/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/19/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/20/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/23/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/25/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/25/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1), K. Walton (1); E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/04/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/09/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue and Proposed OrderNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/21/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/22/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/24/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/28/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), K. Walton (1), M. Works (1), J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to DischargeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/30/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Discharging CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/05/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/08/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/11/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/12/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting HearingNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), K. Walton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from R. Remington (1); E-mail to R. Remington (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review Trial listNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/12/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to J. Ward (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile CourtNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/12/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting Formal HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/13/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/16/2019 2.70 $202.50$75.00

Attend formal hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/20/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Disposition, etc.Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/22/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/29/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to R. Remmington (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/31/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and Review Email from H. Bates (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/31/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/01/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Bates (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Bates (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/04/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/05/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (3), K. Walton (2); E-mail to R. Remmington (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review Letter F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/24/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from R. Remington (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to R. Remington (1); Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (1), F. Al-HaidariNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/08/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/09/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (1), K. Walton (1); E-mail to F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/10/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (3), K. Walton (2); Email to F. Al-Haidari (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/13/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/15/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1), K. Walton (1), F. AlHaidari (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/16/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/21/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/24/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL Report; Call with clientNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/24/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (2), K. Walton (1); Email to F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.60 $45.00$75.00

Attend Hearing (By Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/28/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter 04-28-20Note:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/04/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Letter from F. Al-HaidariNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/11/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review update letter from F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), F. Al-Haidari (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/22/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to F. Al-Haidari (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Mesa (1), F. Al-HaidariNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Update LetterNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/28/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Update LetterNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/16/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and Review Update LetterNote:Review of:Activity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Postage 08/22/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 08/22/2019 2.00 $0.10$0.05

Photo Copies for 08-22-19 (2)Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 10/22/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 10-22-19 (1)Note:Activity:

Postage 10/22/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 11/15/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 11-15-19 (1)Note:Activity:

Postage 11/15/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 01/22/2020 4.00 $0.20$0.05

Photo Copies for 01-22-19 (4)Note:Activity:

Postage 01/22/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 04/28/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 04/28/2020 5.00 $0.25$0.05

Photo Copies for 4/28/20 (5)Note:Activity:

1291.90Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV17-558Docket: Client: Lynch, Jann10525

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 08/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Email to N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to N. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/17/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from N. JohnsonNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/18/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to N. Johnson (1), M. Norrie (1); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1), M. Norrie (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/19/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1; E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/20/2019 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), M. Norrie (2), S. Sidwell (1), N. Johnson (1), L. Camplin (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/21/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/22/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Norrie (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/23/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to M. Norrie (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/24/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to N. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/25/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call to client; E-mail to client (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/25/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/25/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/27/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting Unopposed Motion to Continue ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/03/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/18/2019 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with client and N. JohnsonNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 10/23/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Review of Disposition; Order Discharging Legal Counsel; Order Placing Legal Custody of Juvenile with Mother; Notice of Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter with attached order to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to N. Johnson (2); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/02/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1), S. Sidwell (1), D. Kerr (1); E-mail to D. Kerr (1), S. Sidwell (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/03/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), D. Kerr (1), N. Johnson (1), S. Sidwell (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/07/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/04/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/04/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/05/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1) with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/05/2020 0.65 $48.75$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/05/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with J. BahnNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/12/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Court Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/11/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Email to N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/17/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and Review email from N. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Postage 10/03/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 10/03/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 10-03/19 (1)Note:Activity:
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Copies or Faxes at $.05 10/29/2019 4.00 $0.20$0.05

Photo Copies for 10-29-19 (4)Note:Activity:

Postage 10/29/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 01/14/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 01/14/2020 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 01-14-20 (1)Note:Activity:

605.85Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV18-25Docket: Client: Bridge, Tera11435

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/12/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review biweekly reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/15/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review email from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 02/21/2019 0.45 $29.25$65.00

Attend team meeting; Conference with M. MillsNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/01/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/06/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Email to Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/06/2019 0.25 $16.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (3), L. Camplin (1), L. Bridge (1); E-mail to C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/16/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/18/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to L. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/19/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/21/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Setting Team MeetingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/21/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/21/2019 0.65 $42.25$65.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/22/2019 0.45 $29.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (4), L. Camplin (3), C. Tuner (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/24/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1), L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/25/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1), L. Johnson (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/27/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (2), L. Johnson (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/28/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review bi-weekly reportNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 03/28/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (2), C. Turner (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), L. Johnson (2); E-mail to L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/29/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec with attachment (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/05/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review FCRO ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/07/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/09/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Motion for Bridge OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/09/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), C. Nemec (1), L. Camplin (2), L. Johnson (1), C. Turner (1), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/15/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/15/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/15/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Attend hearing; Conference with PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/15/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/16/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/16/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/17/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/20/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/22/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/22/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with M. Mills (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/22/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (2); E-mail to C. Nemec (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/23/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review email from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/24/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 04/25/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review email from C. Nemec with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/26/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Call to C. NemecNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/29/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with NemecNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/07/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

E-mail to M. Mills (1), C. Nemec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (3), M. Mills (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/08/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

E-mail to C. Nemec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/09/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/10/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review Report from C. Nemec (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/10/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/13/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

E-mail to C. Nemec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/16/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1), C. Turner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/16/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/17/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemec (1), L. Camplin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/20/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/24/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/28/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/28/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/28/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to C. Nemec (1), C. Druepel (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Druepel (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/28/2019 0.75 $48.75$65.00

Attend hearing; conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/28/2019 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/29/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Bridge OrderNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $65.00 06/05/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/06/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 05/31/2019 6.00 $0.30$0.05

Photo Copies May 2019Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 06/05/2019 5.00 $0.25$0.05

June 2018 Photo Copies (5)Note:Activity:

603.05Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV17-323Docket: Client: Keagle, Katie9623

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/05/2018 1.00 $65.00$65.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/05/2018 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Review GAL report and CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/16/2018 0.15 $9.75$65.00

Receive and review Order of Disposition on Count II; Order of Review on Count I: Notice of Review Hearing (2)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/26/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/26/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to parties (1); Receive and review e-mail from G. Steen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 10/29/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review email from S. Sidwell (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/02/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/05/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/15/2018 0.05 $3.25$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/19/2018 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue and Proposed OrderNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 11/27/2018 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/20/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Simon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/25/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

E-mail to C. Simon (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Simon (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), S. Sidwell (1), G. Steen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/25/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/26/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/27/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/27/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), T. Bird (1), G. Steen (3), H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Page: 41 of 69 34884Voucher:06/23/2020



Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025173V34884

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/28/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 03/29/2019 0.20 $13.00$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), G. Steen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/01/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue (in JV17-323, JV18-71, & CI17-2963)Note:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/01/2019 0.35 $22.75$65.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), G. Steen (3), T. Bird (1), C. Simon (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), G. Steen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/04/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue Hearing on ComplaintNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 04/08/2019 0.05 $3.25$65.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/16/2019 0.40 $26.00$65.00

Prepare Stipulation and Bridge OrderNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/17/2019 0.75 $48.75$65.00

Prepare Stipulation and Bridge OrderNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 05/21/2019 1.35 $87.75$65.00

Attend hearing; conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.30 $19.50$65.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Signed Stipulated Order of PaternityNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Decree Establishing Paternity, Custody, and Parenting TimeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $65.00 06/11/2019 0.10 $6.50$65.00

Receive and review Order of Review; Order Terminating Jurisdiction; Order Relieving NDHHS of Responsibility; Order Closing File (2)Note:Review of:Activity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 06/01/2019 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies (3)Note:Activity:

Postage 06/01/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

486.15Total Paid:
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Case ID: JV19-437Docket: Client: Blume, Erica17599

Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order continuing HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Appointing CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 09/12/2019 0.20 $5.00$25.00

Review discoveryNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/12/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Open office fileNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/01/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from W. McEwen (1), D. Langdon (2), M. Burton (1), H. Colton (3), H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/04/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and reivew e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and reivew Order Granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/07/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from W. McEwen with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with client; Conference with PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/28/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Progression OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/28/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Adjudication of Jurisdiction under Neb. Rev. Stat. 43-247(3A) on Count II of the Petition;Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Notice of Acknowledgment of Right to InterveneNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call to client; E-mail to H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 1.25 $93.75$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/02/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), M. Burton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Adjudication of JurisdictionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Dunham (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/03/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/07/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/08/2020 1.75 $131.25$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/08/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), D. Langdon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/08/2020 1.35 $101.25$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (2), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/15/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of DispositionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), D. Langdon (1), H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/22/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/24/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/04/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

E-mail to H. Colton (3); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/04/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Conference with clientNote:Meeting withActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/05/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/25/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/06/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), D. Langdon (1), K. Lauenroth (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail with attachment from D. Gardner (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/11/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (1), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/12/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/18/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Team Meeting and Hearing on MotionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), M. Poland (2), M. Burton (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), D. Langdon (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/24/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3); E-mail to H. Colton (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Approving Emergency Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (2), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion and Affidavit for Emergency Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/26/2020 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Review file and Legal research; E-mail to H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:Research on:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order for HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion for Hearing on Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Review discoveryNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Colton (1), H. Messerschmidt (2), M. Burton (1), D. Langdon (2), J. Judds (1), M. Poland (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/01/2020 1.25 $93.75$75.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Recive and review Order Continuing Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order for Continuing Hearing on Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Recive and review Order Continuing Hearing on Motion for New CounselNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Review Police Report; Review fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/06/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/07/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/08/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Langdon (2), M. Poland (3), E. Exstrom (1), H. Colton (1), T. Dinneen (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/10/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt with attachment (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/14/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/14/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (by Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/15/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/16/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), T. Dinneen (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/17/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Dinneen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/21/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (6), H. Colton (1), T. Dinneen (1), E. Exstrom (2), A. Velder (2); E-mail to M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Review caselaw and file; Prepare for hearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), E. Exstrom (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. Judds (1), H. Colton (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), M. Burton (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/28/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Review caselaw and file; Prepare for hearingNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 04/28/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Exstrom (1), M. Poland (2), T. Dinneen (2), A. Velder (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/29/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3), M. Poland (1); E-mail to H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/29/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with H. ColtonNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/29/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend Hearing (By Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/05/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Sustaining Motion for Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/11/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), H. Colton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/13/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Prepare for hearing; review fileNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/13/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/15/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Coufal (1), D. Langdon (1), T. Dinneen (1), H. Colton (1), E. Exstrom (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Poland (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/28/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.55 $41.25$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Burton (1), M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend hearing (By Zoom) (2)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/11/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/17/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), M. Coufal (1), D. Buckley (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/18/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), K. Belgum (1), D. Buckley (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 06/19/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/19/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (5), M. Poland (1); E-mail to H. Colton (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

2060.00Total Paid:
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Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/30/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), C. Roberts (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/01/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to K. Walton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and reivew e-mail from Lancaster County District Court (2), M. Lamski (1), S. Flynn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/03/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Transferring to Judge Linda Porter; Order Advancing Review of Disposition and Child SupportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/13/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1), C. Roberts (1), J. McNeil (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/14/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (2), K. Walton (1), A. Gordin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/18/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), M. Lamski (1), C. Roberts (1), A. Gordin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), S. Flynn (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to S. Flynn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1), C. Roberts (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion to Change SchoolsNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/11/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order; Notice of Review Hearing, Permanency Planning Hearing, and Child Support HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/16/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/18/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/18/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), A. Gordin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/19/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 12/20/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Sustaining Motion for Change of SchoolNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/20/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with client's familyNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/23/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with G. McKewonNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/07/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with G. McKewonNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (4), T. Vacek (2), A. Gordin (1), G. McKeown (1), K. Walton (1); E-mail to S. Flynn (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/10/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/12/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with PartiesNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/28/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/04/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/20/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/07/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/09/2020 0.65 $48.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (4), S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (2), J. McNeil (2), K. Walton (1), M. Lamski (1), C. Roberts (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/10/2020 0.70 $17.50$25.00

Review visitation notes; Notes to fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/10/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call to G. McKewonNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/14/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), M. Lamski (1), J. McNeil (1), K. Walton (1), S. Flynn (1); Email to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Review HearingNote:Review of:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 04/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Motion and Affidavit for Change of PlacementNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Approving Placement ChangeNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/20/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Letter 04-17-20Note:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), K. Walton (2), A. Gordin (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1), M. Glendening (1), K. Walton (1), A. Kuntz (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/15/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/17/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Lamski (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Lamski (1), C. Roberts (1), A. Kuntz (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/18/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Kuntz (3), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Lamski (3), J. McNeil (2), K. Walton (2), C. Roberts (1), T. Vacek (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), K. Walton (2), M. Lamski (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/19/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/19/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/19/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with G. McKeownNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 12/16/2019 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies for 12-16-19 (3)Note:Activity:

Postage 12/16/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 12/23/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 12/23/2019 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies for 12-23-19 (3)Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 03/04/2020 5.00 $0.25$0.05

Photo Copies for 03-04-20 (5)Note:Activity:

Postage 03/04/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 04/20/2020 2.00 $0.10$0.05

Photo Copies for 04-17-20 (2)Note:Activity:
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Postage 04/20/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

1025.30Total Paid:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 09/13/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Appointing CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 09/19/2019 0.20 $5.00$25.00

Review Pleadings and OrdersNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/19/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Open office fileNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 09/20/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/04/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/08/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Conference with T. VacekNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/17/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. VacekNote:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 10/28/2019 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/14/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), C. Hermsen (2), D. Buckley (1), K. Belgum (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), S. Sidwell (1), D. Buckley (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review email from S. Sidwell (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Advancing HearingsNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/20/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/22/2019 0.15 $3.75$25.00

Phone call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 11/25/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/25/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from FCRO (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call to client's familyNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion for TransportNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/27/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order to TransportNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/27/2019 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call to LSONote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/02/2019 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Review CRCP, FCRO Report, and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.80 $60.00$75.00

Attend hearing; conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Review of DispositionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Regarding Permnancy PlanNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/11/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/18/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to client; Review fileNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/19/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/19/2019 0.80 $60.00$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/19/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/30/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 01/02/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Phone call with E. WilsonNote:Phone CallsActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to T. Vacek (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/10/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (6), V. Gorden (2), C. Zegers (4), S. Sidwell (2) ; E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/13/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), C. Zegers (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to M. Harris (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with E. WilsonNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/15/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/15/2020 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/23/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to TransportNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/24/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Denying Motion to TransportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/29/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/30/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/31/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/04/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/05/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Harris (3); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/05/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/06/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/12/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), E. Wilson (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/17/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 02/18/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1), S. Sidwell (2), E. Wilson (2), S. Sidwell (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/18/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1), S. Sidwell (1), E. Wilson (2); E-mail to M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/19/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/19/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review email from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Regarding Exception Hearing; Determination of an ExceptionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Conference with E. WilsonNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/21/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/24/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review email from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/25/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review email from M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/25/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/26/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (2); E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/02/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), S. Sidwell (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/03/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/04/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), S. Sidwell (1) E. Wilson (1); E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2), V. Gordon (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (2), V. Gorden (1), M. Harris (1), A. Haytr (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/18/2020 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/20/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 03/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), V. Gorden (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Recive and review e-mail from B. Storer (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/23/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2), V. Gorden (2), S. Sidwell (1), C. Zegers (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/24/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from J. Gilgore (1Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing HearingNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/28/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter 04-28-20Note:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/30/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/30/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Review file; E-mail to M. Harris (1), OCC Caseworker (1), J. Gilgore (1)Note:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/04/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from V. Nicholas (2), E. Wilson (1); E-mail to E. Wilson (2), V. Nicholas (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/13/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review the FCRO ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/13/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to M. Harris (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/14/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), C. Zegers (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/15/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), V. Gorden (1), M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Research; review fileNote:Research on:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to M. Harris (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/21/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 06/03/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1), M. Harris (1); Receive and Review email from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/04/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Review file; E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/11/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to E. Wilson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 09/19/2019 127.00 $6.35$0.05

Photo Copies of Pleadings and Orders (127)Note:Activity:

Postage 09/20/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 11/22/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 11-22-19 (1)Note:Activity:

Postage 11/22/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 12/12/2019 6.00 $0.30$0.05

Photo Copies for 12-12-19 (6)Note:Activity:

Postage 12/12/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 12/19/2019 4.00 $0.20$0.05

Photo Copies for 12-19-19 (4)Note:Activity:

Postage 12/19/2019 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 02/25/2020 6.00 $0.30$0.05

Photo Copies for 02-25-20 (6)Note:Activity:

Postage 02/25/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 04/28/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 04/28/2020 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies for 04-28-20 (1)Note:Activity:

1511.95Total Paid:
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Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Appointing CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/06/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing on the PetitionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/08/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Volentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/08/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Open office fileNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/11/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/15/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review email from H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Volentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/15/2019 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Phone call with client.Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/18/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to D. Volentine (1); Receive and review email from C. Martin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/18/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/19/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with clientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/19/2019 0.75 $18.75$25.00

Review discoveryNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/20/2019 1.00 $25.00$25.00

Review discovery videosNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Setting Progression OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/21/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Denial; Order Setting Count I of the Petition for Docket Call and FormalNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 11/21/2019 1.00 $25.00$25.00

Review discovery videosNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/22/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/26/2019 0.40 $30.00$75.00

E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Bice (1), C. Martin (1), J. Judds (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Vollentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 12/03/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/05/2019 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. Judds (1), C. Martin (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call to client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.30 $22.50$75.00

E-mail to M. Paxton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), C. Bice (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/09/2019 0.15 $3.75$25.00

Phone call with client (3)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Cancel DCNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 12/10/2019 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Call to clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/10/2019 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Cancel DC and Proposed OrderNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/20/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/26/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/27/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/27/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/28/2019 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/30/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Martin (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/31/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), H. Messerschmidt (1); E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/02/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/09/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 01/15/2020 0.05 $1.25$25.00

Phone call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/17/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/17/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Paralegal Time - $25.00 01/17/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing on the PetitionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Attend HearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/31/2020 0.85 $63.75$75.00

Attend hearing; Conference with ClientNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/11/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Vollentine (1), Client (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Morrow (1), Client (6)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/11/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with client(1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/11/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 02/11/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Phone call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/12/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/13/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), Client (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/14/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Client (2); E-mail to client (1), D. Vollentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/18/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/03/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Phone call with client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/04/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Phone call with client (3)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/05/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), H. Messerschmidt (1); E-mail to D. Vollentine (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/16/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to D. Vollentine (1); Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (2), C. Bice (1), J. Judds (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call with clientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/18/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve Motion to ContinueNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 03/18/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/21/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/22/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/23/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), H. Vorderstrasse (1),Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Granting Motion to ContinueNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to clientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/25/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/01/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/01/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Call with H. VorderstrasseNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/10/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/13/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), D. Vollentine (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/14/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1) *Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/15/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/28/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/04/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Paralegal Time - $25.00 05/04/2020 0.10 $2.50$25.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/05/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to M. Paxton (1) *Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (2), H. Vorderstrasse (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/06/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with ClientNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Review CRCP and GAL ReportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), M. Paxton (2); Email to H. Vorderstrasse (2), M. Paxton (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with Client (2)Note:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend hearing (via Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/12/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Call with H. VorderstrasseNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/15/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and Review Order of DispositionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/15/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Letter to ClientNote:Correspondence/CommunicationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/29/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Call with H. VorderstrasseNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Expenses

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Copies or Faxes at $.05 11/08/2019 1.00 $0.05$0.05

Photo Copies (1) for 11/8/2019Note:Activity:

Postage 11/20/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 11/21/2019 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies (3) for 11/21/2019Note:Activity:

Postage 11/22/2019 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 01/17/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 01/17/2020 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies (3) for 1/17/2020Note:Activity:
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Copies or Faxes at $.05 02/10/2020 6.00 $0.30$0.05

Photo Copies (6) for 2/10/2020Note:Activity:

Postage 02/11/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 03/25/2020 0.50 $0.50$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Postage 05/19/2020 0.65 $0.65$1.00

PostageNote:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 05/19/2020 7.00 $0.35$0.05

Photo Copies (7) for 5/19/2020Note:Activity:

Copies or Faxes at $.05 05/19/2020 3.00 $0.15$0.05

Photo Copies (3) for 3/25/2020Note:Activity:

1224.45Total Paid:
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Business Unit: 6230 Object Code: 64125

Time

AmountRateQtyDateCategory

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/01/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order Appointing CounselNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Review fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Order for Genetic TestingNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/02/2019 0.90 $67.50$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/03/2019 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Open office fileNote:OtherActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 10/11/2019 0.15 $3.75$25.00

Receive and Review discoveryNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/23/2019 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (2), J. Watkins (1), M. Lamski (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Travel to and from GAL visitNote:OtherActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 10/29/2019 1.00 $75.00$75.00

Attend GAL visitNote:Home VisitActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/01/2019 0.55 $41.25$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/01/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Journal Entry and OrderNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 11/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Adjudication of JurisdictionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/04/2019 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend predisposition meetingNote:Meeting withActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/04/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), M. Lamski (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/08/2019 1.45 $108.75$75.00

Review CRCP and fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 0.70 $52.50$75.00

Attend hearingNote:Hearing:Activity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 12/09/2019 1.35 $101.25$75.00

Prepare, file and serve GAL report; Review CRCPNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/11/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of DispositionNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 12/17/2019 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Bi-weekly reportNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/06/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/08/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/21/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/23/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/29/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), A. Osborn (1), L. Johnson (1), M. Lamski (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/30/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order granting ContinuanceNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/30/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), Lancaster County JV Court (1), L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 01/31/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hanson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/10/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Lamski (1), T. Hansen (2), C. Cooke (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/10/2020 1.10 $82.50$75.00

Call with C. CookeNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/11/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), M. Lamski (1), A. Osborn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/12/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (4), L. Johnson (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/20/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend team meetingNote:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 02/20/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

E-mail to L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/08/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Review CRCPNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 1.30 $97.50$75.00

Prepare, file, and serve GAL report; Review file and CRCPNote:Draft/Document PreparationActivity:

Page: 66 of 69 34907Voucher:06/23/2020



Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice Code: 67954 Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/09/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/10/2020 1.20 $90.00$75.00

Attend hearing (SJB for CCW)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/11/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/11/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), L. Johnson (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/12/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), L. Johnson (1), A. Osborn (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/12/2020 0.50 $12.50$25.00

Review visitation notesNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/13/2020 0.50 $12.50$25.00

Review visitation notes; Notes to fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/17/2020 0.15 $11.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/24/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of Child Support (2)Note:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 03/25/2020 1.00 $25.00$25.00

Review visitation notes; Notes to fileNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/27/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (4), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), L. Johnson (2); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/30/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen with attachment (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 03/31/2020 0.25 $18.75$75.00

Call with S. HardestyNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/01/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/01/2020 0.80 $60.00$75.00

Call with C. CookeNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1), T. Hansen (1); E-mail to C. Cooke (2), T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Call to witnessNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/02/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (via Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/03/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

Call with J. SloanNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/06/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), S. Hardesty (2)Note:EmailingActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 04/22/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), M. Lamski (2); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/23/2020 0.45 $33.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), L. Johnson (2), A. Osborn (1), M. Lamski (2); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 04/27/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen with attachment (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/29/2020 2.40 $60.00$25.00

Review visitation notesNote:Review of:Activity:

Paralegal Time - $25.00 04/30/2020 1.40 $35.00$25.00

Review visitation notesNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/07/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/08/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/12/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/14/2020 0.50 $37.50$75.00

Attend team meeting (By Zoom)Note:Attending Team MeetingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/19/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/20/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/26/2020 0.40 $30.00$75.00

E-mail to S. Betta Cole (3); Receive and review e-mail from S. Betta Cole (2); Review fileNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/27/2020 0.30 $22.50$75.00

E-mail to T. Hansen (3); Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/28/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to C. Cooke (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 05/29/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to C. Cooke (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/01/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

E-mail to C. Cooke (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (2)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/02/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/02/2020 0.75 $56.25$75.00

Call with C. CookeNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/02/2020 0.35 $26.25$75.00

Attend GAL visit (By Zoom)Note:Home VisitActivity:
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Attorney Time - $75.00 06/03/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1), T. Hansen (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 1.60 $120.00$75.00

Review CRCP; Prepare, file, and serve GAL report; Call to D. McMillanNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 0.20 $15.00$75.00

Call with C. CookeNote:Phone CallsActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/09/2020 0.05 $3.75$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from A. Hallberg (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.65 $48.75$75.00

Attend hearing (By Zoom)Note:Hearing:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/10/2020 0.95 $71.25$75.00

Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (5) with attachments (2), A. Osborn (4), L. Johnson (1), M. Lamski (2), A. Hall berg (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); E-mail to A. Johnson (1), M. Lamski (1), A. Hallberg (2), Lancaster County Juvenile CouNote:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/11/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

E-mail to C. Cooke (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)Note:EmailingActivity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/12/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Order of ReviewNote:Review of:Activity:

Attorney Time - $75.00 06/15/2020 0.10 $7.50$75.00

Receive and review Bi-weekly UpdateNote:Review of:Activity:

2200.00Total Paid:

Report Total Paid: $19,388.30
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 Staff Lead Sean 
Flowerday 

Christa 
Yoakum 

Deb Schorr Roma 
Amundson 

Rick Vest 

Fiscal Accountability Priorities       

Increase County Cash Reserves D. Meyer X 
    

Expand County Fleet Program R. Walla  
  

X 
 

Miscellaneous Expenses Policy ???  
  

X 
 

Increase Usage of Enterprise Rental Car Program R. Walla  
  

X 
 

Establish Retirement Committee as Standing Committee K. Eagan X 
    

  
 

    

County Infrastructure Priorities  
 

    

Facility Study for County Engineering Buildings P. Dingman  
 

X X 
 

Fund for Roads and Bridges Crisis ??? X   X 
 

       

Good Governance Priorities       

Draft and Implement County-wide Strategic Plan New CAO X 
  

X 
 

Write County Task Force SOP's D. Cary X 
    

Create a County Central Code K. Eagan X 
    

Fee and Fine Reform Grant A. Ames X 
    

Annual Report (Rolling Report?) A. Ames  
    

Monthly Updates from Planning and IS Depts K. Eagan  
    

On-board new CAO K. Eagan X 
 

X 
  

Leadership Academy A. Ames  
 

X 
  

Establish New Employee Onboarding Program D. Schorr   X   

Establish Realtor Association Legislative Committee as Standing 
Committee 

R. Amundson    X 
 

       

Technology Upgrades/Improvement Priorities       

CJIS Construction and Implementation T. Duncan X     

County-wide Implementation of Pay Roll Software D. Meyer X     

       

Legislative Priorities       

24/7 Drug Testing Kissel Kohout X     

Mental Health Shared Information Kissel Kohout X     

Bridge Bonding Kissel Kohout X     

Mental Health Advance Directives Kissel Kohout X     

Funding for Adult Criminal Justice Reform and Bond Reform Kissel Kohout X     

Funding for Juvenile Justice Reform Kissel Kohout X     

Property Tax Relief Kissel Kohout X     

  
 

    

Criminal Justice Reform Priorities  
 

    

Examine Internal Lower Incarceration Efforts S. Flowerday X     

Examine Internal Lower Incarceration Efforts for Females D. Schorr   
X 

  

SAMHSA Learning Collaborative D. Schorr   
X 

  

Stepping Up Summit D. Schorr X  X 
  

Sherriff Body Camera Program T. Duncan X     

  
 

    

Inclusive Community Priorities       

Work with City of Lincoln to secure Welcoming Community certification C. Yoakum   X 
  

Reinstating the Lincoln/Lancaster Women's Commission C. Yoakum X     

Adding Additional VBM Drop Boxes S. Flowerday X  X   

Successful 2020 Census Promotions S. Flowerday X 
    

My City Academy - Ready to Run Initiative C. Yoakum  
 X 

  

County Inclusive Benefits Policy S. Flowerday X 
    

  
 

    

Safe Community Priorities  
 

    

Norris School EMS Coverage D. Schorr X  
X 

  

Establish Mutual-Aid Meeting as Standing Committee R. Amundson  
 

X X 
 

       

Human Service Priorities       

Increase Human Service JBC Funding S. Flowerday X     

Explore Expanded Home Visiting Program to Combat Childhood Trauma S. Flowerday X     

  
 

    

County Employee Priorities  
 

    

County Employee Prescription Drug Initiative D. Schorr X  X   
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